CITY OF LOMA LINDA
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA
REGULAR MEETING OF OCTOBER 8, 2019

A regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Loma Linda is scheduled to be held Tuesday, October
8, 2019 in the City Council Chamber, 25541 Barton Road, Loma Linda, California. Pursuant to Municipal
Code Section 2.08.010, study session or closed session items may begin at 5:30 p.m. or as soon thereafter as
possible. The public meeting begins at 7:00 p.m.

Reports and Documents relating to each agenda item are on file in the Office of the City Clerk and are
available for public inspection during normal business hours. The Loma Linda Branch Library is also
provided an agenda packet for your convenience. The agenda and reports are also located on the City’s
Website at www.lomalinda-ca.gov.

Materials related to an item on this Agenda submitted to the City Council after distribution of the agenda
packet are available for public inspection in the City Clerk’s Office, 25541 Barton Road, Loma Linda, CA
during normal business hours.  Such documents are also available on the City’s website at
www.lomalinda-ca.gov subject to staff’s ability to post the documents before the meeting.

Persons wishing to speak on an agenda item, including any closed session items, are asked to complete an
information card and present it to the City Clerk prior to consideration of the item. When the item is to be
considered, please step forward to the podium, the Chair will recognize you and you may offer your
comments. The City Council meeting is recorded to assist in the preparation of the Minutes, and you are
therefore asked to give your name and address prior to offering testimony.

The Oral Reports/Public Participation portion of the agenda pertains to items NOT on the agenda and is
limited to 30 minutes; 3 minutes allotted for each speaker. Pursuant to the Brown Act, no action may be
taken by the City Council at this time; however, the City Council may refer your comments/concerns to staff
or request that the item be placed on a future agenda.

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you need special assistance to participate in
this meeting, please contact the City Clerk at (909) 799-2819. Notification 48 hours prior to the meeting
will enable the City to make reasonable arrangements to ensure accessibility to this meeting. Later
requests will be accommaodated to the extent feasible.

A recess may be called at the discretion of the City Council.

Agenda item requests for the November 12, 2019 meeting must be submitted in writing to the City
Clerk no later than Noon, Thursday, October 29, 2019.

A. Call To Order

B. Roll Call

C. Closed Session — 6:00 p.m. - Public Employee Discipline/Dismissal/Release - Government Code
Section 54957 (continued from September 10, 2019)

D. Invocation and Pledge of Allegiance — Councilman Dupper (In keeping with long-standing

traditions of legislative invocations, this City Council meeting may include a brief, non-
sectarian invocation. Such invocations are not intended to proselytize or advance any one, or to
disparage any other, faith or belief. Neither the City nor the City Council endorses any particular
religious belief or form of invocation.)


http://www.lomalinda-ca.gov/
http://www.lomalinda-ca.gov/

Im

I

|

|T

Items To Be Added Or Deleted

Oral Reports/Public Participation - Non-Agenda Items (Limited to 30 minutes; 3 minutes

allotted for each speaker)

Conflict of Interest Disclosure - Note agenda item that may require member abstentions due to
possible conflicts of interest

Scheduled and Related Items

1 Public Hearing - Council Bill #0-2019-05 (First Reading/Set the Second Reading for
November 12, 2019) Amending and adopting the Building Code comprised of the
following Codes [Community Development/Building]

a. 2019 California Building Code, Volumes 1 and 2, based on the 2018 International
Building Code

b. 2019 California Existing Building Code, based on the 2018 International Existing
Building Code

C. 2019 California Historical Code

d. 2019 California Energy Code

e. 2019 Administrative Code

f. 2019 California Referenced Standards Code

g. 2019 California Residential Code, based on the 2018 International Residential
Code

h. 2019 California Green Building Standards Code

i. 2019 California Mechanical Code, based on the 2018 Uniform Mechanical Code
J- 2019 California Electrical Code, based on the 2017 National Electrical Code

k. 2019 California Plumbing Code, based on the 2018 Uniform Plumbing Code

I 2018 International Property Maintenance Code

m. 1997 Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings

2. Public Hearing - California Fire Code [Fire Department]

a. Council Bill #0-2019-06 - (First Reading/Set the Second Reading for
November 12, 2019) — 2019 California Fire Code based on the 2018 International
Fire Code

b. Council Bill #R-2019-38 - Adopting findings relating to the adoption of the 2019
California Fire Code

C. Council Bill #0-2019-07 (First Reading/Set the Second Reading for November 12,
2019) — Adopting the 2018 International Wildland Urban Interface Code

3. Public Hearing - Tentative Tract Map No. P18-124 for Map 20226 - demolition of an
existing housing structure and entitlement of a 16-lot single-family residential
subdivision and one lettered lot (“A”) for open space, drainage and landscape purposes
on a 4.52 acres located south of 1% Street and west of California Street within Low
Density Residential Land Use Designation and Single-family Residential Zone. APN’s:
0293-032-30 and 0292-041-51 [Community Development]



1<

|x

Consent Calendar

Demands Register

4

5. Minutes of September 10, 2019

6 August and September 2019 Fire Department Reports
7

Award of contract for the Installation of Fiber Optic Conduit Improvement at Richardson
Street by directional boring method (CIP 19-653) [Public Works]

8. Appropriate $7,000 from Public Library Facility Fund Balance and award contract for
installation of flooring at the Loma Linda Branch Library, 25581 Barton Road [Public

Works]
9. Amend Safety Compensation Plan [City Manager]
a. Job Description and Salary Range — Fire Marshal 1 & Il
b. Council Bill #R-2019-40 - adopting the Miscellaneous and Safety Compensation

Plans as one document for fiscal years 2019-2020 pursuant to CA Code of
Regulation 570.5

10. Approve an appropriation of $227,600 to cover increases to the previously approved Law
Enforcement Services Contract Schedule A [City Manager]

11. Council Bill #R-2019-44 - authorizing application for, and receipt of SB 2 Planning
Grants Program funds [Community Development]

11.1  Disposition of real property at The Groves at Loma Linda: [Assistant City Manager]
a. Agreement with Land Advisors Organization, California Division (LAO)

b. Appropriate funds and approve an agreement with Urban Futures for Long-Range
Property Management Plan Implementation Service

Old Business

12. Council Bill #0-2019-04 (Set Second Reading Roll Call Vote) - Development Code
Amendment No. P19-095 - A City initiated ordinance to amend Chapter 17.40
(Commercial and Industrial Zones) in Title 17 (Zoning) of the Loma Linda Municipal
Code by removing Note 1 found in Section 17.40.020 (Land Use Regulations and
Allowable Uses) [Community Development]

New Business

13. Council Bill #R-2019-39 - Approving policies and procedures for implementation of the
Automated License Plate Reader system [City Attorney]

14, March 3, 2020 General Municipal Election [City Clerk]
a. Council Bill #R-2019-41- Calling and Giving Notice of the Election

b. Council Bill #R-2019-42 - Adopting regulations pertaining to Candidates
Statements



15. Joint Meeting of the City Council and Housing Authority [Assistant City Manager]

a. LLHA Bill #R-2019-03 — Approving a Third Amendment to Affordable Housing
Agreement by and among the Loma Linda Housing Authority, the City of Loma
Linda and Mary Erickson Community Housing

b. Council Bill #R-2019-43 — Approving a Third Amendment to Affordable
Housing Agreement by and among the Loma Linda Housing Authority, the City
of Loma Linda and Mary Erickson Community Housing

L. Reports of Councilmen (This portion of the agenda provides City Council Members an
opportunity to provide information relating to other boards/commissions/committees to which City
Council Members have been appointed).

M. Reports Of Officers (This portion of the agenda provides Staff the opportunity to provide

informational items that are of general interest as well as information that has been requested by the
City Council).

16. San Bernardino International Airport Annual SBD Fest personnel support for set-up and/or
tear-down [City Manager]

N. Adjournment

Next regular meeting scheduled for November 12, 2019



Rhodes Rigsby, Mayor

City Of Loma Linda John Lenart, Mayor pro tempore

Ovidiu Popescu, Councilman

e o Phillip Dupper, Councilman
OffICIaI Re po rt Ronald Dailey, Councilman

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA:  October 8, 2019 Approved/Continued/Denied
By City Council
TO: City Council Date
FROM: Patrick Johnson, CBO, PE, Willdan Engineering
SUBJECT: Public Hearing - Council Bill #0-2019-05 (First Reading/Set the Second
Reading for November 12, 2019) Amending and adopting the Building
Code

RECOMMENDATION

The adoption of the 2019 California Code of Regulations requires the City Council to conduct a Public
Hearing. Staff has advertised the adoption of the proposed codes in three (3) public areas which are:
Civic Center Outdoor Kiosk, 25541 Barton Road; Loma Linda Branch Library, 25581 Barton Road; and
Post Office Annex, 25925 Barton Road on Tuesday, September 24 and Tuesday, October 1,2019.

Staff recommends that the City Council

a. Conduct a public hearing on the adoption of the California Code of Regulations Title 24
b. Introduce Council Bill #0-2019-05 pm First Reading, and
C. Set the Second Reading/Roll Call VVote for November 12

BACKGROUND

The State’s Health and Safety Code, Section 17950, mandates the California Building Standards
Commission adopt and publish the California Codes, Title 24, known as the California Code of
Regulations.

Every three years, the codes are published to incorporate all code changes accepted by a majority vote of
members at the annual code development meetings. As a result, the new codes will become effective
statewide on January 1, 2020. (See attached Bulletin 19-04 from the Building Standards Commission).
Each jurisdiction in the State is mandated to adopt the California Code of Regulations, Title 24, and make
amendments to the codes that are reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or
topographical conditions. Staff has not made any changes to the provision of the 2019 California Code of
Regulations.

DISCUSSION

The following codes mandated by the State of California Building Standards for local adoption by
January 1, 2020, are:

2019 California Building Code, Volumes 1 and 2
2019 California Existing Building Code

2019 California Historical Code

2019 California Energy Code

2019 Administrative Code

CC AGENDAITEM 1


bnicholson
Typewritten Text
CC AGENDA ITEM 1


2019 California Referenced Standards Code

2019 California Residential Code

2019 California Green Building Standards Code

2019 California Mechanical Code

2019 California Electrical Code

2019 California Plumbing Code

2018 International Property Maintenance Code

1997 Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings

The proposed Ordinance will amend the existing chapters of the Loma Linda Municipal Code Title 15, by
adding the 2019, California Code of Regulations.

The State has established the 2018 Editions of the International Codes as the basis for the 2019 California
Codes. Likewise, the 2018 Editions of the Uniform Mechanical and Plumbing Codes developed by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials as the basis for the 2019 California
Plumbing and Mechanical Codes. The 2017 Edition of the National Electrical Code developed by the
National Fire Protection Association are the basis of the corresponding 2019 Edition of the California
Electrical Code.

The California Residential Code (CRC) will address the structural and life safety aspects of one and two
family dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories. Electrical, plumbing and mechanical issues
will still be addressed by the appropriate California Code Books.

The California Green Building Standards Code addresses such issues as site development, water savings,
recycling and material selection. In addition, issues such as moisture control, interior and exterior air
guality and compliance with California Title 24 requirements as addressed. Environmental quality issues
of concern involve the use of materials that produce volatile organic compounds such as composite wood
products, paints, adhesives and carpets.

FINANCIAL IMPACT

Willdan Engineering has purchased a 2019 set of new code books for the City of Loma Linda Building
Department at a cost of $1,150, and therefore there is no fiscal impact on the City of Loma Linda.

ATTACHMENTS
State of California — State and Consumer Services Agency Information Bulletin 19-04
Council Bill #0-2019-05 (redlined)



DEPARTMENT OF GENERAL SERVICES GOVERNOR GAVIN NEWSOM

BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
2525 Natomas Park Drive, Suite 130

Sacramento, California 95833-2936

(916) 263-0916 FAX (916) 263-0959

CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION
INFORMATION BULLETIN 19-04

DATE: June 24, 2019

TO: LOCAL BUILDING DEPARTMENTS
STATE AGENCIES AND DEPARTMENTS
CBSC INTERESTED PARTIES

SUBJECT: 2019 California Building Standards Code — Now Available

This bulletin provides information regarding the publication of the 2019 California
Building Standards Code, including the effective date and application, availability and
enforcement responsibility. Information concerning emergency building standards is
also addressed herein.

The 2019 California Building Standards Code, Title 24, California Code of Regulations
(Title 24) will be published on or before July 1, 2019 and is now available for purchase.

Effective Date and Application of the 2019 California Building Standards Code

January 1, 2020 is the statewide effective date established by the California Building
Standards Commission (CBSC) for the 2019 California Building Standards Code. In
accordance with California Health and Safety Code, Section 18938.5, all applications for
a building permit submitted on or after January 1, 2020 are subject to compliance with
the 2019 California Building Standards Code. CBSC Information Bulletin 19-03 issued
May 23, 2019 provides valuable information relative to permit issuance and the time
duration of permits.

The 2016 California Building Standards Code remains in effect and is applicable to all
plans and specifications for, and to construction performed where the application for a
building permit is received on or before December 31, 2019.

Page 1 of 4



Availability of the 2019 California Building Standards Code
The 2019 edition of Title 24 may be purchased from the following publishers:

¢ International Code Council (ICC)
ICC Online Store: shop.iccsafe.org
Telephone: ICC Store (800) 786-4452

e International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials (IAPMO)

IAPMO Online Store: www.iapmomembership.org
Telephone: (909) 472-4208

e National Fire Protection Association (NFPA)
NFPA Online Store: www.nfpa.org
Telephone: (800) 344-3555

Enforcement Responsibility

Title 24 is the minimum standard established in law for the design and construction of
buildings and structures in California. State law mandates that local government enforce
these regulations, or local ordinances with qualified reasonably necessary and generally
more restrictive building standards than provided in the California Building Standards
Code.

Exceptions are building standards applicable to hospitals, state buildings, public schools
and colleges that are subject to enforcement by state agencies. For detailed information
regarding enforcement responsibilities refer to Chapter 1, Division 1, commencing with
Section 1.1, of the California Building Code, Part 2, Volume 1 of Title 24.

References in law pertaining to enforcement responsibility include but are not limited to
Health and Safety Code Sections 17950, 17958.7, 17960, 18938 and18941.5.
Additional information may be found in CBSC's guide It's your Building Department
which was developed to help elected officials and executive managers of city and
county governments understand the responsibilities of their building department that are
established in state law.

Amendment by Local Ordinance

Local ordinances that amend Title 24 building standards are subject to requirements of
California law and must be enacted and filed for each edition of Title 24. Ordinances
generally must exercise more restrictive standards than the building standards
approved/adopted by the commission. These amendments must be filed and accepted,
as appropriate, with CBSC, the Department of Housing and Community Development or
the State Historical Building Safety Board before they are enforceable at the local level.
CBSC'’s Information Bulletin 19-05, being issued shortly, contains additional information
and resources to assist local jurisdictions with the local ordinance filing requirements.

References in law pertaining to local ordinance adoption include but are not limited to
Health and Safety Code Sections 13143.5, 17950, 17958, 17958.5, 17958.7, 18938,
18941.5 and 18959. The Local Code Ordinances webpage on CBSC’s website has a
number helpful resources including the 2019 edition of the Guide for Local Amendments
of Building Standards, examples of ordinances that were filed in accordance with state
law, and the updated California Code Adoption for Local Jurisdictions webinar.

Page 2 of 4



Significant Changes to Title 24

Following are some significant changes in the 2019 edition of Title 24. For matters not
listed here, please refer to the margin markings in the new publication, which identify
deletions from and additions to the code.

e Part 1 California Administrative Code (CAC)

The 2019 CAC, Chapter 1 was amended by CBSC to include requirements for filing and
the processing of appeals and petitions, a new section to address certification of
delegation of authority, new provisions to address the readoption of emergency building
standards, and a new requirement for state adopting agency submittals. Additionally,
the Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development (OSHPD) added new
definitions and abbreviations for seismic performance categories to Chapters 6 and 7.

e Part 2 California Building Code (CBC)

The 2019 CBC is based on the 2018 International Building Code (IBC). OSHPD
relocated its remaining provisions from Chapter 34A pertaining to existing structures_to
the 2019 California Existing Building Code (CEBC), Part 10, Title 24.

e Part 5 California Plumbing Code (CPC)

The 2019 CPC is based on the 2018 Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC). Chapters 15 and
16, pertaining to alternate water sources and rainwater catchment, in the 2018 UPC
were significantly reorganized, specific to alternative water sources for non-potable
applications and rainwater catchment systems. Amendments have been made to
address the reorganization of the model code.

e Part 10 California Existing Building Code (CEBC)

The 2019 CEBC is based on the 2018 International Existing Building Code. Chapters 3
and 4 pertaining to all compliance methods and prescriptive compliance methods were
significantly reorganized, therefore it was necessary for the various state agencies that
adopt and amend those chapters to propose amendments accordingly. As previously
noted herein, the remainder of the California amendments affecting building standards
for existing structures are now located within the 2019 CEBC.

Note: In previous publications the California Historical Building Code (Part 8) and the
CEBC (Part 10) were made available in the back of the CBC Volume 2 binder. The
2019 California Building Standards Code publication combined Parts 8, 10 and 12 (the
California Referenced Standards Code) into one binder in an effort to make the codes
more user-friendly and manageable.

Emergency Building Standards

Emergency building standards were adopted into the 2016 California Building
Standards Code and carried forward to the 2019 California Building Standards Code as
follows:

Page 3 of 4



e The Office of Statewide Health Planning and Development (OSHPD)

Emergency building standards contained in rulemaking file number OSHPD EF 01/18
will allow hospitals to apply for seismic safety upgrade extensions pursuant to AB 2190
(Chapter 673, Statutes of 2018). AB 2190 authorizes OSHPD to promulgate emergency
regulations.

OSHPD proposed emergency administrative standards for the 2016 California
Administrative Code, Part 1, Title 24, California Code of Regulations. These regulations
were carried forward to the 2019 California Administrative Code, Part 1, Title 24,
California Code of Regulations with additional modifications to align with changes
related to new acronyms OSHPD 1R and 5, describing the types of facilities that each
acronym applies, were added throughout the 2019 edition of the California Building
Standards Code.

e The Department of Housing and Community Development (HCD)

Emergency building standards contained in rulemaking file number HCD EF 01/18
modify both the California Building Code and the California Residential Code by adding
appendix chapters for local adoption to address emergency shelter housing.

Pursuant to AB 932 (Chapter 786, Statutes of 2017) HCD created emergency
regulations via appendix chapters to create a consistent and available source of
information by which local agencies may develop emergency housing or shelter
ordinances, and to provide consistent standards for HCD to perform its review of local
jurisdiction emergency shelter housing ordinance provisions. See the information
bulletin issued by HCD at the following link: HCD Information Bulletins
http://hcd.ca.gov/information-bulletins.shtml. Upon arrival at the HCD website, select the
State Housing Law accordion, select Information Bulletin 2018-05 (SHL, FBH, CM) —
Emergency Housing - Permanent Adoption of Emergency Regulations Effective
December 7, 2018 for 2016 California Building Code and 2016 California Residential
Code.

Questions or comments regarding the subject of this information bulletin should be
directed to this office at either (916) 263-0916 or email CBSC.

MR

Mia Marvelli
Executive Director

Page 4 of 4



Council Bill #0-2019-05

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LOMA LINDA,
STATE OF CALIFORNIA, AMENDING CHAPTERS 15.04, 15.08, AND 15.60 OF
THE CITY OF LOMA LINDA MUNICIPAL CODE PERTAINING TO
BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION BY ADOPTING THE 2019 CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING THE 2019 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
VOLUMES 1 & 2, 2019 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE, 2019
CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL CODE, 2019 ENERGY CODE, 2019
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARD
CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA GREEN
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE,
2019 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, 2019 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL
CODE, 2018 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, 1997
UNIFORM CODE FOR ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LOMA LINDA DOES ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. (Adoption) of Chapters 15.04, 15.08, and 15.60 of Title 15 (Buildings
and Construction) is hereby amended to read as follows: (underlining and italicized indicates
amended language, strikeeuts indicates removal of language)

Chapter 15.04 GENERAL PROVISIONS

15.04.010 Applicability.

The requirements of this chapter are general in nature and apply to all the provisions in Chapters
15.08, 15.12, 15.16, 15.20, 15.24 and 15.36. (Ord. 193 § 19, 1978)

15.04.020 Definitions.

Whenever in any of the codes adopted in Chapter 15.08, 15.12, 15.16, 15.20 or 15.24 there appears a
reference to the following names or terms, those names or terms shall be deemed and construed as
follows:

A.  “City of” or any other similar reference to a political entity means the incorporated territory of
the city of Loma Linda.

B.  “City council” means the city council of the city of Loma Linda.

99 ¢

C. “Building official,” “electrical safety engineer,” “administrative authority” or any other similar
term which makes reference to the individual official, board, department, or agency created by law to
administer and enforce the provisions of the codes adopted by Chapters 15.08, 15.12, 15.16, 15.20 and
15.24 shall mean the director of building and safety and his authorized assistants. (Ord. 193 § 20, 1978)

D. “Code,” Refers to the current adopted building code as established in Section 15.08.010.



http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_010&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_020&frames=on

Ordinance No.
Page 2

15.04.030 Fees deleted.

Any and all references to fees in any of the Uniferm Codes adopted in Chapters 15.08, 15.12, 15.16,
15.20 and 15.24 are deleted and referred to the building and safety fee resolution adopted by the city.
(Ord. 193 § 21, 1978)

15.04.040 Annual permits permitted when.

A.  Where any person, firm, or corporation in the course of normal maintenance procedures
proposes to install, alter or repair any electrical wiring, devices appliances, plumbing, drainage systems,
septic tanks, seepage pits, leaching lines, heating, ventilating, refrigeration or water equipment in an
existing facility located on property under the direct controls of said person, firm or corporation and is
able to, and does in fact, furnish inspection service which meets the requirements and rules and
regulations of the city and whose operations are under the continuous supervision of a professional
engineer or engineers, duly registered with and licensed by the state, such person, firm, or corporation
shall be required only to obtain an annual permit or annual permits.

B.  The fee for each separate annual permit (electrical, plumbing, mechanical) shall be based on the
number of employees doing work in the crafts covered in each annual permit in accordance with the fee
ordinances adopted by the city.

C. The designated responsible supervising engineer shall file with the building and safety
department a written report specifying the work done under the issued annual permit. Such written report
shall be filed with the department of building and safely within thirty days following the end of the fiscal
year for which the permit was issued. (Ord. 193 § 22, 1978)

15.04.050 Enforcement and interpretation duty.

It shaII be the duty of the dlrector of the bU|Id|ng and safety department to enforce the prOV|S|ons of the

Gedes—ttespeeﬂvety and to determme the mtent and meanlng thereof (Ord 193 § 23 1978)

15.04.060 Preliminary soil report requirements.

A.  Subdivision maps shall not be given a final approval until a preliminary soil report prepared by a
civil engineer registered by the state has been filed with and approved by the director of building and
safety.

B. The preliminary soil report shall indicate the presence, if any, of expansive soils or another soil
problem, which, if not corrected, would lead to structural defects. If defective soil conditions are
indicated, the preliminary report shall include recommendations for corrective measures intended to
prevent structural damage to buildings erected on the site. Acceptance and approval of these
recommendations shall not preclude the consideration and approval of alternate methods of correction
which may be submitted by any other California-registered civil engineer when accompanying a permit
application for construction of a specific building or buildings.

C. The preliminary soil report shall be based upon test borings or excavations. The number of
borings or excavations shall be adequate to determine fully the extent and degree of soil problems, if any,
which exist in the proposed subdivision; provided, however, that not less than three such borings or
excavations shall be required for each report. If critically defective soil conditions are disclosed by initial
borings or excavations, additional borings or excavations shall be made at the probable building location


http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_030&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_040&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_050&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_060&frames=on

Ordinance No.
Page 3

on each lot or parcel within the subdivision. Appropriate notations shall be made upon the subdivision
map so as to indicate the location and type of defective soil noted in the preliminary report.

D.  The director of building and safety shall approve the preliminary soil report:
1. If no defective soils are present on the site; or

2. If the corrective measures recommended in the report would be likely to prevent structural
damage to any buildings constructed on the site.

E.  The preliminary soil report may be waived when the sole purpose of the subdivision map is to
assemble small lots or parcels into larger lots or parcels or to define, adjust or correct property lines of
existing subdivisions.

F.  The issuance of a building permit for the construction of a building on a lot or parcel of land
which has been found to have defective soils shall be conditioned to the incorporation of an approved
corrective measure intended to prevent structural damage to the building. (Ord. 193 § 24, 1978)

15.04.070 Wasting water prohibited.

Water used as a coolant in any stationary equipment or machinery, or water utilized for heating or
cooling in an industrial process, shall not be wasted but shall be recirculated and reused. Every
evaporative cooler shall be equipped with a circulating pump. (Ord. 193 § 25, 1978)

15.04.080 Penalty fees authorized when.

Where work for which a permit is required by the codes adopted in this title is started or proceeded
with prior to obtaining said permit, the specified fees shall be doubled, or, if said permit is not secured
because of wilful willful neglect, the fee required shall be equal to ten percent of the total value of the
project or two hundred dollars, whichever is less; but the payment of such penalty fees shall not relieve
any persons from fully complying with the requirements of these codes in the execution of the work nor
from any other penalties prescribed in this title; provided, however, that this provision shall not apply to
emergency work when it shall be proved to the satisfaction of the director of building and safety that such
work was urgently necessary and that it was not practical to obtain a permit therefor before
commencement of the work. In all such cases a permit must be obtained as soon as it is practical to do so,
and if there is an unreasonable delay in obtaining such permit, a double fee as herein provided shall be
charged. (Ord. 193 § 26, 1978)

15.04.090 Construction.

In interpreting and applying the provisions of this chapter, they shall be held to be the minimum
requirements for the promotion of public health, safety, and general welfare. (Ord. 193 § 26(a), 1978)


http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_070&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_080&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_090&frames=on

Ordinance No.
Page 4

15.04.100 Public nuisance declared when.

Any building or structure erected or maintained, or any use of property, contrary to the provisions of
this title shall be unlawful and a public nuisance, and the city attorney shall, upon order of the director of
building and safety, immediately commence an action or actions, proceeding or proceedings, for the
abatement, removal and enjoinment thereof in the manner provided by law and shall take such steps and
shall apply to such court or courts as may have jurisdiction to grant such relief as will abate or remove
such building, structure, or use, and restrain and enjoin any person from erecting or maintaining such
building or structure or using any property contrary to the provisions of this title. It shall be the right and
duty of every citizen to participate and assist the city officials in the enforcement of the provisions of this
title. (Ord. 193 § 26(b), 1978)

15.04.110 Remedies cumulative.

All remedies provided for in this chapter shall be cumulative and not exclusive. The conviction and
punishment of any person hereunder shall not relieve such person from the responsibility of correcting
prohibited conditions or removing prohibited buildings, structures or improvements, nor prevent the
enforced correction or removal thereof. (Ord. 193 § 26(b) (1), 1978)

15.04.120 Violation—Penalty.

Any person, firm or corporation whether as principal, agent, employee or otherwise violating or
causing or permitting the violation of any of the provisions of Chapter 15.04, 15.08, 15.12, 15.16, 15.20,
15.24 or 15.36 or of any permit or exception granted thereunder, shall be guilty of an infraction. Any
person convicted of an infraction under the provisions of a city ordinance shall be punishable as set forth
in Chapter 1.12. No suspension of sentence or probation shall be granted to any such violator unless there
is included in the terms thereof that the violator shall comply with the provisions which he or she has
been convicted of violating and shall abate or correct the illegal condition, alteration, enlargement,
conversion, movement or maintenance of any building established, constructed, operated or maintained
contrary to the provisions of this title. (Ord. 193 § 26(b)(2), 1978)

15.04.130 Violation—Each day a separate offense.

Each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense upon each day
during any part of which any violation of any of the provisions of Chapters 15.04, 15.08, 15.12, 15.16,
15.20, 15.24 or 15.36 is committed, continued, permitted or maintained by such person, firm or
corporation and shall be punishable therefor as provided in Section 15.04.120. (Ord. 193 § 26(b)(3),
1978)

15.04.140 Violation—Notice of pendency.

A notice of pendency of administrative action or proceeding may be filed in the county recorder’s
office at the time of the commencement of action or proceeding or at any time before final judgment or
order. The county recorder shall record and index the pendency of action in the name of each person
specified in the action or proceeding. After all required work has been completed and approved, the
director of building and safety shall record in the office of the county recorder a document terminating
said notice. (Ord. 193 § 26(b)(4), 1978)


http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_100&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_110&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_120&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_130&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_140&frames=on

Ordinance No.
Page 5

15.04.150 Violation—Abatement authorized when.

In the event that any person, firm or corporation fails, neglects or refuses to demolish, remove, abate or
correct a structure or condition existing in violation of this title upon his, her or its property after a civil
court order or criminal conviction obtained pursuant to Sections 15.04.100 through 15.04.150, the city
council may order the director of building and safety to demolish, remove, abate or correct the offending
structure or condition. A statement of the cost of such work shall be transmitted to the city council who
shall cause the same to be paid and levied as a special assessment against the property. (Ord. 193 §
26(b)(5), 1978)

Chapter 15.08 BUILDING CODE AND BUILDING CODE STANDARDS

15.08.010 Adoption by reference.

For the purpose of prescribing regulations for erecting, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair,
improving, removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment use, height, and area of buildings and
structures, the following construction codes subject to the modifications set forth in this chapter, are
hereby adopted: the California Building Code Volumes 1 & 2, 2016 2019 Edition, based on the 2645 2018
International Building Code as published by the International Code Council; the California Existing
Building Code, 2016 2019 Edition, based on the 20845 2018 International Existing Building Code as
published by the International Code Council; the California Historical Building Code, 2019 Edition; the
California Residential Code, 2016 2019 Edition, based on the 2045 2018 International Residential Code
as published by the International Code Council; the California Green Building Standards Code, 2016
2019 Edition; the California Plumbing Code, 2046 2019 Edition, based on the 2045 2018 Uniform
Plumbing Code as published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials; the
California Mechanical Code, 2046 2019 Edition, based on the 2045 2018 Uniform Mechanical Code as
published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials; the California
Electrical Code, 2046 2019 Edition, based on the 2034 2017 National Electrical Code as published by the
National Fire Protection Association; the International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 2018 Edition, as
published by the International Code Council; the Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings,
1997 Edition. The provisions of these construction codes as amended by this chapter shall constitute the
building regulations of the city of Loma Linda. Where the California Code of Regulations and State
Building Standards Code of Regulations differ from any sections of the construction codes, state
regulations shall prevail over the construction codes.

One copy of all the above codes and standards therefor are on file in the office of the city clerk
pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 18942(d)(1) and are made available for public inspection.

Notwithstanding the provisions of the above-referenced construction codes, all fees for services
provided pursuant to the construction codes shall not take effect until a resolution for such fees is adopted
by the city council pursuant to California Government Code Sections 66016 and 66020. (Ord. 736 8 1,
2016; Ord. 713 8 1, 2013)

15.08.020 Changes to California Building Code.

The changes set forth herein are made to the 2046 2019 Edition of the California Building Code
Volume 1 & 2 as published by the International Code Council.

A.  Section 105.2 ef-ChapterZ item 2 is amended to read as follows:


http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_04-15_04_150&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_08-15_08_010&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_08-15_08_020&frames=on

Ordinance No.
Page 6

2. Fences not over 6 feet in high.

C.  The requirements of Chapter 7A shall apply throughout the Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area
as designated by the city council.

D. Section 903.2 is amended to read as follows:

[F] 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall
be provided in the locations specified in the Fire Code.

E.  Section 103.2 of Appendix J is amended to read as follows:

J103.2 Exemptions. A grading permit shall not be required for the following:

1. Grading in an isolated, self-contained area, provided there is no danger to the public, and that
such grading will not adversely affect other properties, and does not exceed 50 cubic yards (38.3 m?) and
is less than 12 inches (305 mm) in fill depth or 2 feet in cut depth.

F.  Section 4069 1401 of the California Existing Building Code is amended by adding the following:

409:1 1401.3 Structures moved into or within the jurisdiction shall comply with the provisions of this
code for new structures.

409:2 1401.4 Relocation Building Permit Required. A person shall not move onto any premises, other
than a commercial storage yard authorized for such use, any building or structure, except a contractor’s
tool house, construction building or similar structure which is moved as construction requires, until he or
she first secures a relocation building permit as hereinafter provided.

4093 1401.5 Application. Applicants for relocation permits shall submit color photographs of at least
two (2) separate elevations, one of which shall be the front, and a certificate from a pest control agency or
operator licensed under the Structural Pest Control Act of California, showing freedom from termite
infestation, for each building or structure to be moved, when application for a relocation permit is filed.

4094 1401.6 Application and Investigation Fee. Upon applying for a relocation building permit the
applicant shall pay to the Building Official an application and investigation fee. This fee shall be in
accordance with the Building and Safety Fee Resolution adopted by the City Council of the City of Loma
Linda for inspection of the building or structure at its present location and investigation of the proposed
site.

409.5 1401.7 Building and Relocation Site Inspection and Report. Upon receipt of application for
permit to relocate a building or structure and receipt of payment of the prescribed inspection fee, the
Building Official shall inspect the building or structure to be moved and the proposed relocation site, and



Ordinance No.
Page 7

prepare a written report which shall be forwarded to the applicant. This report shall contain the approval
or disapproval of the Building Official and, if approved for moving, shall contain the requirements
necessary to make the building or structure conform to the requirements of the City regulations for new
buildings and any additional requirements necessary to assure that such relocation shall not have a
detrimental effect, by size, or age, on the living environment and property values in the area into which
the building or structure is to be moved.

(Ord. 736 § 1, 2016; Ord. 713 § 1, 2013)

15.08.030 Changes to California Residential Code.

The changes set forth herein are made to the 2019 Edition of the California Residential Code as
published by the International Code Council.

A. Section R105.2, item 2 is amended to read as follows:

2. Fences not over 6 feet high.
B. Appendix V, Swimming Pool Safety Act, is amended to read as follows:

AV100.2 Construction permit: safety features required.

(&) Except as provided in Section AV100.5, when a building permit is issued for the
construction of a new swimming pool or spa or the remodeling of an existing swimming pool
or spa at a private single-family home, the respective swimming pool or spa shall be
equipped with item #1 and at least one additional of the following seven drowning
prevention features:

1. An_enclosure that meets the requirements of Section AV100.3 and isolates the
swimming pool or spa from the private single-family home. Any walls of the residential
structure or accessory structures used to complete the isolation enclosure must have its
door openings equipped with protection as required in AV100.2 (a) #4 or #5. Any such
door protection device provided for this purpose may not be used to comply with the
second drowning prevention feature requirement.

Chapter 15.60 REPAIR OF DAMAGED STRUCTURES

15.60.010 Adoption and intent.

This chapter establishes regulations as amendments to the California Existing Building Code for the
expeditious repair of damaged structures. In the event an amendment to the California Building Standards
Code results in differences between these building standards and the California Building Standards Code,
the text of these building standards shall govern. In accordance with California Health and Safety Code
Section 17958.7, express findings that modifications to the California Building Standards Code are
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological or topographical conditions are either already
on file with the California Building Standards Commission, or will be filed prior to the effective date of
the ordinance codified in this chapter. In accordance with California Government Code Section 50022.6,
at least one true copy of the California Existing Building Code has been on file with the city clerk since
fifteen days prior to enactment of the ordinance codified in this chapter. While this chapter is in force, a
true copy of this chapter shall be kept for public inspection in the office of the city clerk. A reasonable
supply of this chapter shall be available in the office of the city clerk for public purchase. (Ord. 736 § 1,
2016; Ord. 682 § 1, 2008)


http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_08-15_08_020&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_60-15_60_010&frames=on

Ordinance No.
Page 8

15.60.030 Repairs.

For the purposes of this chapter, the following repair requirements are added as a new subsection
404.6 405.3 to Section 484 405.4 Repairs in the 2016 2019 California Existing Building Code:

404.6-1 405.3.1 Repairs. Repairs of structural elements shall comply with this section in addition to
California Existing Building Code Section 404.

40411 405.3.1.1 Seismic evaluation and design. Seismic evaluation and design of an existing building
and its components shall be based on the following criteria.

404.6-1-1-1 405.3.1.1.1 Evaluation and design procedures. The seismic evaluation and design shall be
based on the procedures specified in the building code, ASCE 31 Seismic Evaluation of EXisting
Buildings (for evaluation only) or ASCE 41 Seismic Rehabilitation of Existing Buildings. The procedures
contained in Appendix A of the International Existing Building Code shall be permitted to be used as
specified in Section 404-6-1-1-3 405.3.1.1.3 of the California Existing Building Code.

4046112 405.3.1.1.2 Level seismic forces. When seismic forces are required to meet the building code
level, they shall be one of the following:

1. 100 percent of the values in the building code. The R factor used for analysis in accordance with
Chapter16-ofthe-buHding-eede current adopted version of ASCE 7 shall be the R factor specified for
structural systems classified as “Ordinary” unless it can be demonstrated that the structural system
satisfies the proportioning and detailing requirements for systems classified as “Intermediate” or
“Special.”

2. Forces corresponding to BSE-1 and BSE-2 Earthquake Hazard Levels defined in ASCE 41. Where
ASCE 41 is used, the corresponding performance levels shall be those shown in Table 4046112
405.3.1.1.2.



http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_60-15_60_020&frames=on
http://qcode.us/codes/lomalinda/view.php?topic=15-15_60-15_60_030&frames=on

Ordinance No.
Page 9

TABLE 4064.6-3-1-2 405.3.1.1.2
ASCE 41 and ASCE 31 PERFORMANCE LEVELS

RISK PERFORMANCE LEVEL

CATEGORY | FOR USE WITH ASCE 31 | PERFORMANCE LEVEL
(BASED ON | AND WITH ASCE 41 BSE-1 [ FOR USE WITH ASCE 41
CBC TABLE | EARTHQUAKE HAZARD | BSE-2 EARTHQUAKE
1604.5) LEVEL HAZARD LEVEL

I Life Safety (LS) Collapse Prevention (CP)

Il Life Safety (LS) Collapse Prevention (CP)

I Note (a) Note (a)

v Immediate Occupancy (10) Life Safety (LS)

a. Performance Levels for Risk Category Il shall be taken as halfway between the performance levels
specified for Risk Category Il and Risk Category IV.

404.6:1-13 405.3.1.1.3 Reduced CBC level seismic forces. When seismic forces are permitted to meet
reduced building code levels, they shall be one of the following:

1. 75 percent of the forces prescribed in the building code. The R factor used for analysis in accordance
with Chapter 16 of the building code shall be the R factor as specified in Section 404-6-1:-1.2 405.3.1.1.2.

2. In accordance with the applicable chapters in Appendix A of the international California Existing
Building Code as specified in Items 2.1 through 2.4 below. Structures or portions of structures that
comply with the requirements of the applicable chapter in Appendix A shall be deemed to comply with
the requirements for reduced building code force levels.

2.1. The seismic evaluation and design of unreinforced masonry bearing wall buildings in Risk
Category I or Il are permitted to be based on the procedures specified in Appendix Chapter Al.

2.2. Seismic evaluation and design of the wall anchorage system in reinforced concrete and reinforced
masonry wall buildings with flexible diaphragms in Risk Category | or Il are permitted to be based on the
procedures specified in Appendix Chapter Al.

2.3. Seismic evaluation and design of cripple walls and sill plate anchorage in residential buildings of
light-frame wood construction in Risk Category | or Il are permitted to be based on the procedures
specified in Appendix Chapter A3.

2.4. Seismic evaluation and design of soft, weak, or open-front wall conditions in multiunit residential
buildings of wood construction in Risk Category | or Il are permitted to be based on the procedures
specified in Appendix Chapter A4.

3. In accordance with ASCE 31 based on the applicable performance level as shown in Table
404.6:1-1.2 105.3.1.1.2.

4. Those associated with the BSE-1 Earthquake Hazard Level defined in ASCE 41 and the performance
level as shown in Table 404-6-13-12 405.3.1.1.2. Where ASCE 41 is used, the design spectral response
acceleration parameters Sxs and Sx1 shall not be taken less than 75 percent of the respective design
spectral response acceleration parameters SDS and SD1 defined by the California Building Code and its
reference standards.



Ordinance No.
Page 10

404.6-12 405.3.1.2 Wind Design. Wind design of existing buildings shall be based on the procedures
specified in the building code.

404.6.2 405.3.2 Repairs to damaged buildings. Repairs to damaged buildings shall comply with this
section.

404.6:2.1 405.3.2.1 Unsafe conditions. Regardless of the ex-tent of structural damage, unsafe conditions
shall be eliminated.

404.6:2:2 405.3.2.2 Substantial structural damage to vertical elements of the lateral-force-resisting
system. A building that has sustained substantial structural damage to the vertical elements of its lateral-
force-resisting system shall be evaluated and repaired in accordance with the applicable provisions of
Sections 404-6.2.2.1 405.3.2.2.1 through 404-6-2.2.3 405.3.2.2.3.

404.6.22-1 405.3.2.2.1 Evaluation. The building shall be evaluated by a registered design professional,
and the evaluation findings shall be submitted to the code official. The evaluation shall establish whether
the damaged building, if repaired to its pre-damage state, would comply with the provisions of the
building code. Wind forces for this evaluation shall be those prescribed in the building code. Seismic
forces for this evaluation are permitted to be the reduced level seismic forces specified in Code Section
404.6.1.1.3 405.3.1.1.3.

4046222 405.3.2.2.2 Extent of repair for compliant buildings. If the evaluation establishes
compliance of the pre-damage building in accordance with Section 404-6:2.2.1 405.3.2.2.1, then repairs
shall be permitted that re-store the building to its pre-damage state, using materials and strengths that
existed prior to the damage.

4046223 405.3.2.2.3 Extent of repair for non-compliant buildings. If the evaluation does not
establish compliance of the pre-damage building in accordance with Section 484-6-2.2.-% 405.3.2.2.1, then
the building shall be rehabilitated to comply with applicable provisions of the building code for load
combinations including wind or seismic forces. The wind design level for the repair shall be as required
by the building code in effect at the time of original construction unless the damage was caused by wind,
in which case the design level shall be as required by the code in effect at the time of original construction
or as required by the building code, whichever is greater. Seismic forces for this rehabilitation design
shall be those required for the design of the predamaged building, but not less than the reduced level
seismic forces specified in Section 404-6-1.13 405.3.1.1.3. New structural members and connections
required by this rehabilitation design shall comply with the detailing provisions of the building code for
new buildings of similar structure, purpose, and location.

404.6.2.3 405.3.2.3 Substantial structural damage to vertical load-carrying components. Vertical
load-carrying components that have sustained substantial structural damage shall be rehabilitated to
comply with the applicable provisions for dead and live loads in the building code. Undamaged vertical



Ordinance No.
Page 11

load-carrying components that receive dead or live loads from rehabilitated components shall also be
rehabilitated to carry the design loads of the rehabilitation design. New structural members and
connections required by this rehabilitation design shall comply with the detailing provisions of the
building code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose, and location.

404.6-2.3-% 405.3.2.3.1 Lateral force-resisting elements. Regardless of the level of damage to vertical
elements of the lateral force-resisting system, if substantial structural damage to vertical load-carrying
components was caused primarily by wind or seismic effects, then the building shall be evaluated in
accordance with Section 404.6-2.2.2 405.3.2.2.1 and, if non-compliant, rehabilitated in accordance with
Section 404-6:2.2.3 405.3.2.2.3.

404624 405.3.2.4 Less than substantial structural damage. For damage less than substantial
structural damage, repairs shall be allowed that restore the building to its pre-damage state, using
materials and strengths that existed prior to the damage. New structural members and connections used
for this repair shall comply with the detailing provisions of the building code for new buildings of similar
structure, purpose, and location.

404.6:3 405.3.3 Referenced Standards

Standard Referenced
Reference In Code
Number Title Section Number

ASCE 31-03 Seismic Evaluation of Existing Buildings 404-6-3-1% 405.3.1.1.1, TABLE 404.6.:.12
405.3.1.1.2, 404.6-1-1-3, 405.2.1.1.3

ASCE 41-06 Seismic Rehabilitation of Existing Buildings 404-6-++% 405.3.1.1.1, 4046112
405.3.1.1.2, TABLE 404.6-1-1.2 405.3.1.1.2, 404-6-1-1.3 405.3.1.1.3

(Ord. 736 § 1, 2016; Ord. 682 § 1, 2008)

SECTION 2: If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause, or phrase
of this Ordinance or any part thereof is for any reason held to be unconstitutional, such decision
shall not affect this validity of the remaining portion of this Ordinance or any part thereof. The
City Council hereby declares that it would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision,
paragraph, sentence, clause, or phase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more
sections, subsection, subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses, or phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

SECTION 3: This Ordinance shall be in full force and effective a minimum of thirty (30)
days after passage. The effective date of this Ordinance is January 1, 2020.




Ordinance No.
Page 12

SECTION 4: Prior to the expiration of fifteen (15) days from its passage, the City Clerk shall
cause this Ordinance to be posted pursuant to law in three (3) public places designated for such
purpose by the City Council.

This Ordinance was introduced at the regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Loma
Linda, California, held on the day of 2019 and was adopted on the day of
2019 by the following vote to wit:

Ayes:
Noes:
Abstain:
Absent:

Rhodes Rigsby, Mayor

Attest:

Barbara Nicholson, City Clerk



Rhodes Rigsby, Mayor

City Of Loma Linda John Lenart, Mayor pro tempore

Ovidiu Popescu, Councilman

e o Phillip Dupper, Councilman
OffICIaI Report Ronald Dailey, Councilman

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA:  October 8, 2019 Approved/Continued/Denied
By City Council

TO: City Council Date

FROM: Dan Harker, Fire Chief

SUBJECT: Public Hearing - California Fire Code

a.  Council Bill #0-2019-06 - (First Reading/Set the Second Reading
for November 12, 2019) — 2019 California Fire Code based on the
2018 International Fire Code

b.  Council Bill #R-2019-38 - Adopting findings relating to the
adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code

C. Council Bill #0-2019-07 (First Reading/Set the Second Reading for
November 12, 2019) — Adopting the 2018 International Wildland
Urban Interface Code

RECOMMENDATION

The adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code and the 2018 International Wildland Urban Interface Code
requires the City Council to conduct a Public Hearing. Staff has advertised the adoption of the proposed
codes in three (3) public areas: Civic Center Outdoor Kiosk, 25541 Barton Road; Loma Linda Branch
Library, 25581 Barton Road; and Post Office Annex, 25925 Barton Road and published in the local
newspaper on Tuesday, September 24 and Tuesday, October 1,2019.

Staff recommends that the City Council:

a. Conduct a public hearing on the adoption of the 2019 California Fire Code and the 2018
International Wildland Urban Interface Code

b. Introduce Council Bill #0-2019-06 and #0-2019-07 on First Reading

C. Set the Second Reading/Roll Call Vote for November 12

d. Adopt Council Bill #R-2019-38 adopting findings relating to the adoption of the 2019

California Fire Code

BACKGROUND

The California Building Standards Commission adopts and amends the California Building Standards
Code, California Code of Regulations, Title 24 (CCR, T-24), incorporating the latest editions of model
codes for use throughout the State. The 2049 California Building Standards Code consists of multiple
parts, including Part 9- the California Fire Code (CFC), based on the 2018 Edition of the International
Fire Code (IFC) published by the International Code Council- which will take effect on January 1, 2020.
The Building Standards Law and the State Housing Law allow local governments to amend CCR, T-24
based on express findings that the amendments are necessary due to local climatic, geological or
topographical conditions. The locally-adopted amendments take effect upon filing, with the applicable
findings, with the California Building Standards Commission.

The 2019 CFC applies to all state-regulated occupancies (buildings); but, since there are occupancies,

procedures and conditions that are not regulated by the state, local government may also adopt the
corresponding model code upon which the CFC is based (i.e., the IFC).

CC AGENDAITEM 2


bnicholson
Typewritten Text
CC AGENDA ITEM 2


ANALYSIS

The adoption of the latest edition of the model fire code every three years is a standard procedure utilized
by the City of Loma Linda since incorporation. This cycle the model fire code utilized by the California
Building Standards Commission is the 2018 Edition of the International Fire Code. Since the Building
Standards Commission determined that the IFC contains certain provisions that apply to buildings
throughout the state, the City has also amended those provisions as published in the CFC. Our local
amendments tend to generally be consistent from adoption to adoption. However, revisions, additions
and deletions are made based on need and/or the further development of language contained within the
model code.

FINANCIAL IMPACT

None anticipated.



Council  Bill  #0-2019-06

ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LOMA LINDA
ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 2016-2019 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
FIRE CODE, ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 206452018 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AND REPEALING CHAPTER 15.28 OF THE
MUNICIPAL CODE.

The City Council of the City of Loma Linda does hereby ordain as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapter 15.28 of Title 15 of the Loma Linda Municipal Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

Chapter 15.28
FIRE CODE
Sections:
15.28.010 Findings and Adoption of the California Fire Code and the International Fire Code
15.28.020 Definitions
15.28.030 Establishments of Limits Required by the California Fire Code

15.28.040-570 Amendments to the California Fire Code and the International Fire Code
15.28.010 Findings and Adoption of the California Fire Code and the Internarional Fire Code
@ FINDINGS. The City Council of the City of Loma Linda hereby finds and determines:

1. That the International Code Council (ICC) is a private organization which has been in
existence for a period of at least three years.

2. That the International Fire Code (IFC), 206452018 Edition, published by said
organization, is a nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules, regulations, and standards of said
organization.

3. That said International Fire Code has been printed and published as a code in book form
within the meaning of Section 50022.2 et seq. of the California Government Code.

4, That the California Fire Code (CFC), also known as the California Code of Regulations,
Title 24, Part 9 - a portion of the "California Building Standards Code" as defined in the "California
Building Standards Law" commencing with Section 18901 of the Health and Safety Code - is assigned to
the California Building Standards Commission, which by law is responsible for approving all building
standards within the State of California. The 20462019 edition of the California Fire Code incorporates
by reference the 20452018 edition of the International Fire Code, with necessary California amendments.

5. That one copy of the 20462019 California Fire Code and 20152018 International Fire
Code, certified by the Clerk of the City of Loma Linda to be a true copy, have been filed for use and
examination by the public in the Fire Prevention office of the Fire Department of the City of Loma Linda.

6. The sections of said California Fire Code and International Fire Code may be referred to
by the number used in said published compilation, preceded by the words "California Fire Code Section™
or International Fire Code Section” or "Fire Code Section,” and may also be referred to by additional
reference to the Loma Linda Municipal Code and sections therein pertaining to said California Fire Code
and International Fire Code.

CC AGENDAITEM Z2a


bnicholson
Typewritten Text
Council Bill #O-2019-06

bnicholson
Typewritten Text
CC AGENDA ITEM 2a


Ordinance No.
Page 2

7. That the additional requirements and standards established herein are needed to properly
protect the health, safety, and welfare of the existing and future residents and workers within the City of
Loma Linda. Said requirements and standards are reasonably necessary because of local climatic,
geological, and topographical conditions, and comply with existing state laws and regulations. Express
findings of local necessity supporting the additional requirements and standard listed herein are found in
Resolution No. 2671 adopted by the City Council.

(b) ADOPTION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE.

The City Council of the City of Loma Linda hereby adopts and amends the 206462019 Edition of
the California Fire Code, and California Fire Code Appendix Chapter 4, and California Fire Code
Appendices B & bb, C & cc, D and H; as compiled and adopted by the California Building Standards
Commission.

The City Council of the City of Loma Linda hereby adopts the 206462018 Edition of the
International Fire Code, as compiled and published by the International Code Council.

15.28.020 Definitions.
@ Wherever the word "Jurisdiction" is used in said Fire Code, it shall mean the City of Loma Linda.

(b) Wherever the term "Corporation Counsel" is used in said Fire Code, it shall mean the City
Attorney for the City of Loma Linda.

(c) Wherever the term "Fire Department™ is used in said Fire Code, it shall mean the Fire Department
of the City of Loma Linda.

(d) An employee of the Fire Department of the City of Loma Linda, when enforcing the California
Fire Code, the International Fire Code, the Loma Linda Municipal Code and other laws, rules and
regulations relating to fire and life safety, fire prevention and fire investigation, shall be deemed a "Peace
Officer" as those words are used in Section 830.31 of the California Penal Code.

15.28.030 Establishment of Limits Required by the California Fire Code
@ Storage of Flammable Cryogenic Fluids.

Pursuant to Section 5504.2.1 through 5504.2.2.3 of the California Fire Code, flammable
cryogenic fluids shall not be permitted to be stored, dispensed, or used unless, in the opinion of the fire
code official, such storage will not create an unacceptable threat to the occupants and property owners.

(b) Storage of Explosives and Blasting Agents.

Pursuant to Section 5604.4 of the California Fire Code, the storage of explosives and blasting
agents is prohibited in all areas unless authorized by the fire code official.

(© Storage of Class I and 11 Liquids.

Pursuant to Section 5404.2 and 5706.2.4.4 of the California Fire Code, the storage of Class | and
Class 1l liquids in outside aboveground unprotected tanks is prohibited in all areas of the City unless the
fire code official determines, with specific documented findings, that such an installation will not create a
hazard to life or property in the area.



Ordinance No.

Page 3
(d)

Storage of Liquefied Petroleum Gases.

Pursuant to Section 6104.2 of the California Fire Code, the aggregate capacity of any one

installation for the bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gases shall not exceed 2,000 water gallons (7571
L) in commercial, residential and other areas where, in the opinion of the fire code official, the location of
bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gases would create a threat to life and property.

15.28.040 Section 101.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Loma Linda,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

15.28.050 Section 104.12 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

104.12 Liability.

104.12.1 General. The fire chief, the fire code official and other individuals charged by the fire
chief with the control or extinguishment of any fire, the enforcement of this code or any other
official duties, acting in good faith and without malice in the discharge of their duties, shall not
thereby be rendered personally liable for any damage that may accrue to persons or property as a
result of any act or by reason of any act or omission in the discharge of their duties. Any suit
brought against the fire chief, fire code official or such individuals because of such act or
omission performed in the enforcement of any provision of such codes or other pertinent laws or
ordinances implemented through the enforcement of this code or enforced by the code
enforcement agency shall be defended by this jurisdiction until final termination of such
proceedings, and any judgment resulting therefrom shall be assumed by this jurisdiction subject
to the provisions of Government Code Section 825.

This code shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the responsibility of any person owning,
operating or controlling any building or structure for any damages to persons or property caused
by defects, nor shall the code enforcement agency or its parent jurisdiction be held as assuming
any such liability by reason of the inspections authorized by this code or any permits or
certificates issued under this code.

104.12.2 Cost Recovery. Fire suppression, investigation and rescue or emergency medical costs
are recoverable in accordance with Health and Safety Code Sections 13009 and 13009.1.

Any person who negligently or intentionally, or in violation of law, causes an emergency
response, including but not limited to, a traffic accident or spill of toxic or flammable fluids or
chemicals, is liable for the costs of securing such emergency, including those costs set out in
Health and Safety Code Section 13009 et seq. and Government Code Section 53150 et seq. Any
expense incurred by the fire department for securing such an emergency situation shall constitute
a debt of such person and shall be collectible by the public agency in the same manner as in the
case of an obligation under contract, expressed or implied.

104.12.3 Expense for Securing an Emergency. The expense of securing any emergency or
hazard which is the result of a violation of this code or any other code, ordinance or State law, or
any damages caused by malicious mischief requiring any corrective or preventive actions
conducted by the fire department may be a charge against the person(s) or entity whose such
emergency or action may constitute a debt of such person(s) or entity and shall be collectible as
provided below.



Ordinance No.
Page 4

1. The fire chief may impose the reasonable cost of fire prevention, fire suppression,
and protection of the public from other safety hazards when a fire or hazardous
condition results from any of the following activities or conditions:

A. Manufacture, transportation, storage, handling, or spilling of hazardous
chemicals, flammable or combustible liquids, explosives, or blasting agents
as defined in Article 2 of this Code;

B. Failure to correct a hazardous condition for which a "Notice of Violation", or
equivalent notice, has been previously given by the chief;

C. Use of welding equipment, cutting torch, tar pot, or other open flame device;

D. Permitting or causing the accumulation of hazardous or flammable materials;

E. Setting of a fire or allowing a fire to be set in violation of any code,
ordinance, law or regulation;

F. Creating, allowing, or maintaining a fire hazard.

2. Determination to Charge Cost. Whenever the fire chief determines that the fire
department or other public agency has incurred costs for fire suppression, fire
prevention, or protection of the public safety when a fire or other hazardous condition
has resulted from the activities specified in this section, he or she shall:

A. Calculate the costs incurred:;
B. Identify the person or persons to be charged for those costs; and
C. Send a report with this information to the City Clerk.

3. Calculation of Costs Incurred. The "costs incurred" shall include all necessary
expenditures to correct the hazardous condition or extinguish the fire, including, but
not limited to:

The cost of personnel;

The cost of extinguishing agents;

The reasonable value of the use of City equipment;

The cost incurred by use of a private contractor to mitigate or remove the
hazard or condition; and

Any and all administrative costs incurred pursuant to Chapter 3.28 of the
Municipal Code.

oowp

m

4. Reimbursement Hearing Set. The City Clerk shall, thereupon, set the report and
account for hearing by the City Council at a regular or adjourned meeting which will
be held at least 14 calendar days after the date the Clerk mails the notice; and shall
send by regular mail a Notice of said hearing to the person or entity to be charged at
the person's or entity's address as shown on the last equalized tax assessor's roll, or as
otherwise known to the City.

5. Notice to Person to be Charged. The Notice sent by the City Clerk to the responsible
person(s) or entity shall contain:

A. The name of the person(s) or entity sought to be charged;

B. The location, date, and time of the evidence upon which the claim for
reimbursement is based;

C. The amount of, and the basis upon which claim for reimbursement is made;

D. The date, time and place of the hearing on the claim for reimbursement with
a statement on the rights of the person or entity to be heard for presenting
evidence at said hearing;

E. The fire chief's account of the sum claimed to be due.



Ordinance No.
Page 5

6. Procedure for Hearing Before the City Council. At the hearing on the fire chief’s
account and other evidence upon which reimbursement is sought, the City Council
shall hear and consider evidence by the person or entity against which reimbursement
is sought; and thereafter, confirm or disallow the account, in all or in part, and set
forth in a resolution the amount of the account confirmed, if any. Thereafter, any
amount confirmed by a resolution of the City Council shall become a debt owing to
the City of Loma Linda and is collectible by the City in the same manner as in the
case of an obligation under contract expressed or implied.

15.28.060 Section 104.10 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

104.10 Fire investigations. The fire code official and the fire department shall have the authority
to investigate the cause, origin and circumstances of any fire, explosion or tother hazardous
condition. Information that could be related to trade secrets or processes shall not be made part of
the public record except as directed by a court of law.

15.28.070 Section 105.2.5 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

105.2.5 Permit Fees. Permit fees as established by City Council Resolution shall be collected by
the Finance Department. Proof of receipt shall accompany all applications for permit applications
prior to inspection and approval by the fire code official.

15.28.080 Section 105.2.6 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

105.2.6 Fees Not Refundable. Permit fees shall not be refundable for any reason after initiation
of inspection procedures.

15.28.090 Section 106.1.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

106.1.1 Inspection fees. The fire code official is authorized to collect appropriate fees for
inspections according to City Council Resolution establishing fees.

15.28.100 Section 109:4110.4 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
109:4110.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a
permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of an infraction,
punishable by a fine of a fine of not more than one hundred dollars ($100.00) for a first
violation; a fine not exceeding two hundred dollars ($200.00) for a second violation within
one year; and a fine not exceeding five hundred dollars ($500.00) for each additional
violation of the within one year. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been
served shall be deemed a separate offense.

15.28.110 Section £09:4-1110.4.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

109-4.1110.4.1 Abatement of violation. In addition to the imposition of the penalties herein
described, the fire code official is authorized to institute appropriate action to prevent unlawful
construction or to restrain, correct or abate a violation; or to prevent illegal occupancy of a
structure or premises; or to stop an illegal act, conduct of business or occupancy of a structure on
or about any premises. The expense of such action may be made a lien upon the property upon
which such condition exists.



Ordinance No.
Page 6

15.28.120 Section 111.4 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with
a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or
unsafe condition, shall be subject to violation penalties pursuant to Section 109.4.

15.28.130 Section 305.6 of the International Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

305.6 Sparks from chimneys. Chimneys used in conjunction with fireplaces or heating
appliances in which solid or liquid fuel is used shall be equipped and maintained with an
approved spark arrester. The spark arrester shall be constructed of 24-gauge stainless steel,
12-gauge copper or brass, 19-gauge woven galvanized wire mesh, or of materials with equivalent
heat and corrosion resistance. Openings shall not permit the passage of spheres having a diameter
larger than 1/2 inch (13 mm) and shall not block the passage of spheres having a diameter of less
than 3/8 inch (10 mm). The screen shall be mounted in or over all outside flue openings in a
vertical or near vertical position, adequately supported to prevent movement and visible from the
ground. The net free area of the spark arrester shall not be less than 4 times the net free area of the
outlet of the chimney.

15.28.140 Section 308.1.7 of the International Fire Code is hereby amendedadded to read as
follows:

308.3.5 Religions ceremonies. Candles held in persons’ hands are especially dangerous and shall
not be permitted. Battery-operated simulated candles are available and may be used. No permit is
required for battery-operated candles or other electric candles.

15.28.150 Section 312.2 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

312.2 Posts. Guard posts shall comply with all of the following requirements:
1. Constructed of steel not less than 6 inches (152 mm) in diameter and concrete filled.
2. Spaced not more than 4 feet (1219 mm) between posts on center.
3. Set not less than 3 feet (914 mm) deep in a concrete footing of not less than a 15 inch
(381 mm) diameter.
4. Set with the top of the posts not less than 3 feet (914 mm) above the ground.
5. Located not less than 3 feet (914 mm) from the protected object.

15.28.160 Section 503.2.3 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

503.2.3 Surface. Fire apparatus access roads shall be designed and maintained to support the
imposed loads of fire apparatus and shall be surfaced with an approved concrete or asphalt
covering so as to provide all-weather driving capabilities. Turf block, Ritter Rings, Turf Paver
and other similar products shall not be used for fire department access surfacing. Where rural
road grades do not exceed 8%, the fire code official may approve access roads of approved native
materials or gravel when compacted to 95%.

15.28.170 Section 503.2.7 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
503.2.7 Grade. The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be a maximum of twelve percent

(12%), unless otherwise approved by the fire code official for short distances when appropriate
mitigation measures are utilized.



Ordinance No.
Page 7

15.28.180 Section 503.4 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads. Fire apparatus access roads shall not be
obstructed in any manner, including the parking of vehicles. The minimum widths and clearances
established in Section 503.2.1 shall be maintained at all times. Any obstruction or impedance to
reasonable access may be removed at the order of the fire code official or the fire department,
with the expense of such removal to be borne by the owner of the roadway, or in the case of an
obstructing vehicle or object, by the owner of said vehicle or object.

15.28.190 Section 505.1 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

505.1 Address Identification. New and existing buildings shall have approved address numbers,
building numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly legible
and visible from the street or road fronting the property. Address numbers and building
identification shall contrast with their background. Address numbers and building identification
shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters. New residential buildings that contain not more than
two dwelling units shall have minimum 4 inch (102 mm) high numbers, with a minimum stroke
width of % inch (13 mm), and shall be internally illuminated by means of a low voltage power
source during the hours of darkness. Where building setbacks exceed 100 feet (30 m) from the
street or road, additional non-illuminated 4 inch (102 mm) numbers shall be displayed at the
property entrance. Other buildings shall have minimum 8 inch (203 mm) high numbers, with a
minimum stroke width of 1 inch (25 mm). Such address numbers shall be electrically illuminated
by an internal or external source furing the hours of darkness. Buildings with a total floor area of
100,000 square feet (9290 m?) or greater shall have minimum 12 inch (305 mm) high numbers,
with a minimum stroke width of 1% inches (38 mm). Such address numbers shall be electrically
illuminated by an internal or external source during the hours of darkness. Where building
setbacks exceed 200 feet (61 m) from the street or road, additional non-illuminated 6 inch (152
mm) high numbers shall be displayed at the property entrance. Individual suite addresses shall be
displayed with minimum 4 inch (102 mm) high constrasting numbers or letters placed on the
front and rear doors of tenant areas in buildings, where applicable.

15.28.200 Section 316.7 of the International Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

316.7 Smoke or fog emitting systems. No alarm system shall be installed in a building or portion
of a building which as a part of its operation discharges any gas, vapor, liquid, or other product
when the primary intent of the system discharge is to obscure the vision of any person, cause
disorientation, or incapacitate any person within the building or portion thereof. Nothing in this
section is intended to preclude the connection of an alarm system to any fire suppression system.

15.28.210 Section 507.5.1 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

507.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or
moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 300 feet (91 m) from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the exterior of the facility or
building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where required by the fire code
official.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be not more
than 600 feet (183 m). This distance may be further modified by the fire code official
for such occupancies when buildings are equipped throughout with an approved fire
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3.

2. Deleted.



Ordinance No.
Page 8

15.28.220 Section 509.3 of the International Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

509.3 Access to equipment in multi-unit buildings. When automatic fire sprinkler systems or
fire alarm systems are installed in buildings constructed for multiple tenants and these systems
protect multiple tenant spaces, the main controls and control appurtenances, such as risers, fire
alarm control panels, and valves for such systems, shall be located in an attached or included
room or an approved weather-resistant enclosure with at least one exterior access dooor of not
less than 3°-0” by 6°-8”.

15.28.220.40 Section 901.7 of the California Fire Code hereby amended to read as follows:

901.7 Systems out of service. Where a required fire protection system is out of service, the fire
department and the fire code official shall be notified immediatley and, where required by the fire code
official, the building shall be either evacuated or an approved fire watch shall be provided by a trained
third party company. Fire watch shall remian in place until all fire protection systems and violations are
corrected and inspected by the fire code official.

15.28.220.50 Problematic systems:

Add 901.11 Problematic systems. In the event of a failure of a fire protection system or 2 or more
alarms in a week where the fire code official finds no evidence of a situation requiring a response, the fire
code official is authorized to require the building owner or occupant to provide with at least one approved
means for notification of the Fire Department and the building to be placed on fire watch by a trained
third party company.

15.28.230 Section 903.2.1.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.1 Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-1
occupancies.

15.28.240 Section 903.2.1.2 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-2
occupancies.

15.28.250 Section 903.2.1.3 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-3
occupancies.
15.28.260 Section 903.2.1.4 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-4
occupancies.

15.28.270 Section 903.2.1.5 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
903.2.1.5 Group A-5. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group A-5 occupancies
in the following areas: concession stands, retail areas, press boxes, and other accessory use areas in

excess of 200 square feet (19 m?).

15.28.275 Section 903.2.2 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:



Ordinance No.
Page 9

903.2.2 Ambulatory care facilities. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout all
fire areas containing an ambulatory care facility occupancy when either of the following conditions
exist at any time:

1. Four or more care recipients are incapable of self-preservation.
2. One or more care recipients who are incapable of self-preservation are located at other
than the level of exit discharge serving such an occupancy.

15.28.280 Section 903.2.3 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.3 Group E. Except as provided for in Sections 903.2.19 for a new public school campus
and 907.2.3.6.1 (fire alarm and detection) for modernization of an existing public school campus
building(s), an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E occupancies as follows:
an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E occupancies as follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 200 square feet (19 m?) in area.

2. Throughout every portion of educational buildings below the level of exit dischange.

3. In rooms or areas with special hazards such as laboratories, vocational shops and other

such areas where hazardous materials in exempt amounts are used or stored

15.28.290 Section 903.2.4 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.4 Group F. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings
containing a Group F occupancy where the fire area exceeds 200 square feet (19 m?).

15.28.300 Section 903.2.4.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby deleted.
15.28.310 Section 903.2.7 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where the fire area exceeds 200 square feet (19 m?).

15.28.320 Section 903.2.8 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3 shall
be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area.
Exceptions:

1. Deleted.

2. When approved by the fire code official, detached Group U private garages
accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy, when located 50 feet (15,240 mm) or
more from property lines or dwellings.

3. Group R-3.1 occupancies not housing bedridden clients, not housing
nonambulatory clients above the first floor, and not housing clients above
the second floor.

4. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13113, occupancies housing
ambulatory children only, none of whom are mentally ill or mentally
handicapped, and the buildings or portions thereof in which such children
are housed are not more than two stories in height, and buildings or portions
thereof housing such children have an automatic fire alarm system activated
by approved smoke detectors.

5. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13143.6, occupancies licensed
for protective social care which house ambulatory clients only, none of



Ordinance No.
Page 10

whom is a child (under the age of 18 years), or who is elderly (65 years of
age or over).

15.28.330 Section 903.2.9 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.9 Group S-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings
containing a Group S-1 occupancy where the fire area exceeds 200 square feet (19 m?).

15.28.340 Section 903.2.9.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings used as repair garages in accordance with the California Building Code.

15.28.350 Section 903.2.9.2 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires. Buildings and structures where the area for the storage of tires
exceeds 200 square feet (19 m?) shall be equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system
in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

15.28.360 Section 903.2.10 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended by the deletion of the
exception.

15.28.370 Section 903.2.10.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.10.1 Commercial parking garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout buildings used for storage of commercial trucks or buses where the fire area exceeds
200 square feet (19 m?).

15.28.380 Section 903.2.11 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended by the deletion of the
exception.

15.28.390 Section 903.2.11.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

903.2.11.1 Stories and basements without openings. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
installed in every story or basement of all buildings where the floor area exceeds 200 square feet
(19 m?) and where there is not provided at least one of the following types of exterior wall
openings:
1. Openings below grade that lead directly to ground level by an exterior stairway
complying with Section 1009 or an outside ramp complying with Section 1010.
Openings shall be located in each 50 linear feet (15 240 mm), or fraction thereof, of
exterior wall in the story on at least one side.
2. Openings entirely above the adjoining ground level totaling at least 20 square feet
(1.86 m?) in each 50 linear feet (15 240 mm), or fraction thereof, of exterior wall in
the story on at least one side.

15.28.400 Section 903.2.11.3 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended by the deletion of the
exception.

15.28.410 Section 903:2:20903.2.21 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

903.2:20903.2.21 Group B. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
buildings containing a Group B occupancy where the fire area exceeds 200 square feet (19 m?).



Ordinance No.

Page 11

15.28.420 Section 903.3.1.3 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one- and two-
family dwellings shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D, including attached

garages.

15.28.420.10 Exterior audible and visible alarm notification

Add 903.4.2.1 Exterior audible and visible alarm notification shall be provided on NFPA 13,
NFPA 13R, and NFPA 13D systems.

15.28.430 Section 903.3.10 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

903.3.10 Water supply for areas without City water service. In areas without City water
service, buildings where the fire area exceeds 200 square feet (19 m?) shall be provided with an
approved automatic sprinkler system. Group R-3 occupancies shall be provided with on-site
water storage for a minimum 10 minute sprinkler demand. When approved by the fire code
official, on-site water storage for other than Group R occupancies may be reduced to that required
for an approved 30 minute sprinkler demand. These flows and duration do not consider the needs
required to provide domestic service. All sprinkler systems shall be suitably freeze-protected for
climatic conditions when necessary.

Exception: When approved by the fire code official, detached Group U private

garages accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy, when located 50 feet (15,240 mm)

or more from property lines or dwellings.

15.28.440Section 903.7 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

903.7 Area Increase and Reconstruction. Every existing building or structure relocated or
moved onto a property, every building or structure which as a result of fire, earthquake, or other
disaster requires demolition and reconstruction exceeding fifty percent (50%) of its original area;
or every existing building or structure receiving an addition exceeding fifty percent (50%) of the
original area, or a remodel that involves demolition, relocation or reconstruction of existing walls
or other structural members exceeding fifty percent (50%) of the original area, or a combination
addition and/or remodel, shall have an approved automatic sprinkler system installed throughout
therein.

15.28.450Section 903.8 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

903.8 Change in Use. Changes made in the character or use of an occupancy shall be approved
by the building official and the chief. When there is a change of use or occupancy of a building
which exceeds 5,000 square feet in floor area which would place the building in a different
division of the same group of occupancy or in a different group of occupancies, the occupancy
shall be provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system throughout, unless the proposed
use is less hazardous based on fire or life safety risk, than the existing use.

15.28.460 Section 905.4 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended by adding item number 7 to
read as follows:

7. When required by other provisions of this code, 2% inch hose connections, meeting
the requirements of this section and fire department standards, shall be located at
every other exterior fire department access door as defined by Section 2306.6.1, and



Ordinance No.
Page 12

arranged so that every portion of the building and its contents can be reached with
150 feet of hose and stream.

15.28.470 Section 910.1 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

910.1 General. Where required by this code or otherwise installed, smoke and heat vents or
mechanical smoke exhaust systems and draft curtains shall conform to the requirements of this
section.

Exceptions:
1. Frozen food werehouses used solely for storage of Class | and Il commodities
where protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system.
2. Deleted.

15.28.480 Section 910.3.4 of the California Fire Code is hereby amendedadded to read as follows:

910.3.4 Sprinklered buildings. Where installed in buildings equipped with an approved
automatic sprinkler system, smoke and heat vents shall be designed to operate automatically by
the actuation of a heat responsive device rated at least 100 degrees F above the operating
temperature of the sprinkler heads, or manually with independent controls for the fire department
pursuant to Section 914.12.

15.28.490 Section 914.12 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

914.12 Special requirements for Group F, M, S-1 or S-2 distribution warehouses greater
than 50,000 square feet in floor area. Buildings classified primarily as Group M, Group S-1 or
S-2, with no more than 10% of the building square footage occupied with accessory uses, in
which the primary use is wholesale or retail sales of bulk products or packaged materials, or for
the storage of commaodities for distribution, shall be in accordance with this section.

914.12.1 Fire Control Room. A fire control room for fire department opertations shall
be provided. The location and accessibility of the fire control room shall be approved by
the fire code official. The fire control room shall be separated form the remainder of the
building by walls and ceilings not less than one-hour fire partitions. The room shall be a
minimum of 96 square feet (9 m? in area, with a minimum dimension of 8 feet (2438
mm). The room shall contain the following as a minimum:
1. The fire alarm control unit and associated equipment.
2. Annunciator panel displaying status of sprinkler control valves and
waterflow detectors.
3. Main controls and indicators for mechanical smoke exhaust systems.
4. Graphic with schematic indicating building floor plans, means of egress, fire
protection systems, firefighting equipment and access.
5. Other firefighting equpment and system controls as required by the fire code
official.
6. Emergency lighting powered by the standby electrical system.

914.12.2 Mechanical smoke exhaust. A mechanical smoke exhaust system conforming
to the requirements of Section 910.4 shall be provided. The system may be conbined with
environmental or other ventilation air systems when approved by the fire code official.

914.12.3 Standpipe systems. A class | standpipe system shall be provided, with hose
connections located at fire department access doors as required by Section 905.4. The



Ordinance No.
Page 13

15.28.500

15.28.510

15.28.520

system may be inerconnected with the building automatic sprinkler systems, and may be
supplied by adjacent systems or by a separate riser. Standpipe systems shall conform to
the requirements of NFPA 14.

914.12.4 Fire department graphic. A printed graphic with schematic diagrams of the
building automatic sprinkler systems, fire alarm systems, means of egress, standpipe
systems, smoke exhaust systems, access doors, and any other equipment as required by
the fire code official shall be superimposed over a building floor plan or site plan and
mounted on the wall in a highly visible location in the fire control room. The graphic
shall be durable and waterproofed.

914.12.5 Standby power. A standby power generator conforming to the California
Electrical Code shall be provided on the premises, in a protected location. The generator
shall have a rated capacity necessary to supply the load of all fire protection features
listed below at the same time:

Emergency lighting and exit signs necessary for egress.

Lighting for the fire control room.

Signal and communication systems as applicable.

Electrically powered fire pumps required to maintain pressure.

Mechanical smoke exhaust systems as required by Section 914.12.2.

aogrwbdE

In addition, a fuel supply sufficient for not less than two hours of oepration shall be
required on the premises. All electrically connected systems shall be transferred within
60 seconds after losing primary power.

914.12.6 Enhanced communications. When required by the fire code official, enhanced
communication equipment, such as bi-directional amplifiers, shall be provided in the
building for dedicated use by the fire department. When such eequipment is required to
be installed, it shall be provided with a standby power supply.

914.12.7 Other requirements. All fire protection systems shall comply with fire
department standards regarding installation, signage and labeling, maintenance, and other
requirements as specified by the fire code official.

Table 3206.2 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended by the deletion of Footnote j.

Section 5601 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

5601.1.3 Fireworks. Possession, sale, storage or use of fireworks, including “Safe and
Sane” fireworks as defined in Health and Safety Code Section 12529, is prohibited.

5601.3.1 Seizure of fireworks. The fire chief, fire code official or fire department is
authorized to seize, remove or cause to be removed, at the expense of the owner, all
stocks of fireworks offered or exposed for sale, stored, held or handled in violation of this
chapter.

Section 4902, the Definition of WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREA is hereby

amended to read as follows:

WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE FIRE AREA is a geographical area identified by
the state as a “Fire Hazard Severity Zone” in accordance with the Public Resources Code



Ordinance No.
Page 14

Sections4201 through 4204 and Government Code Sections 51175 through 51189, or
other areas designated by the enforcing agency to be at a significant risk from wildfires.

15.28.530 Section 4914 of the California Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION 4914
FIRE PROTECTION PLAN

4914 General. A Fire Protection Plan (FPP), approved by the fire code official, shall be
required for all new development within the Wildland-Urban Interface Area.

The FPP shall include mitigation measures consistent with the unique problems resulting from the

location, topography, geology, flammable vegetation, and climate of the proposed site.

The FPP shall address water supply, access, building ignition and fire resistance, fire protection

systems and equipment, defensible space and vegetation management.

The FPP shall be consistent with the requirements of California Bulding Code Chapter 7A, the

International Wildland-Urban Interface Code, and the Loma Linda Municipal Code.

15.28.540 Section B105.2 of Appendix B of the California Fire Code is hereby amended by

amending the Exception to read as follow:

Exception: A reduction in required fire-flow of up to 50 percent (50%),
as approved, is allowed when the building is provided with an approved
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or
903.3.1.2. The resulting fire-flow shall not be less than 1,500 gallons per minute
(5678 L/min) for the prescribed duration as specified in Table B105.1.

15.28.550 Section B-107 of the International Fire Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Section B-107
Underground Fire Loop Requirements

B- 107.1 General: Commercial; Industrial; Institutional; Multi-Family Residential, will require a
dedicated Two (2) point of commection looped fire water system fed from appropriately sized
water mains.

B-107.2 Specifics: Any development within the City of Loma Linda that consists of more than a
single structure on a commercially developed site; multiple floor commercial structures; multi-
family commercial residences or fire flow requirements in excess of 2000 gpm will require a two
point of connection full looped fire supply to the development. All required onsite fire hydrants
will be supplied from this looped system and will be private to the development. When there are
practical difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions of this ordinance the Fire Code
Official is authorized to grant modifications for individual cases on application in writing by the
owner or a duly authorized representative. The code official shall first find that a special reason
makes enforcement of the strict letter of the ordinance impractical and any modificatioin or
change does not lessen any fire protection requirements. If so changes or modifications may be
approved by the Fire Code Official or Fire Chief.

15.28.560 Section 6951204 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:




Ordinance No.
Page 15

Section 605-311204.1
SOLAR PHOTVAIC POWER SYSTEMS.

605:-11-1204.1 Solar photovoltaic pewer systems shall be installed in accordance with
section 605:11:11204.2.1 through 505:21.21204.5,the California Building Code or the California
Electrical Code.
Exceptions:
1. Deleted
2. Roof access, pathways and spacing requirements need not be provided where the Fire
Code Official determined that rooftop operations will not be employed.

605:111.21204.2.1 Solar photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings.
Solar photovoltaic systems for Group R-3 buildings shall comply with sections
605:11-1.2.1-1204.2.1. 1through 605-14-1.2.51204.2.1.3.

Exception — Deleted.

605-11.2.51204.2.1.4 Allowance for smoke ventilation operations. Panels and modules
installed on Group R-3 buildings shall be located no less than 3-feet (914mm) from the ridge in
order to allow for fire department smoke ventilation operations.

Exception — Deleted.

605-11.1.2.61204.2.3 Location of conductors. All conduits shall be run on top of the
roof and not in attic spaces. Conduit wiring systems and combiner boxes for photovoltaic circuits
shall not be located near the fire department access pathways. Conduit runs between sub arrays
and to combiner boxes shall be installed in a manner to reduce trip hazard and to minimize the
total amount of conduit on the roof by taking the shortest path from the array to the combiner
boxes.

15.28.560.10 Section 1206.2 Stationary battery storage systems of the California Fire Code
hereby amended to read as follows:.




Ordinance No.
Page 16

Section 1206.2 Stationary battery storage systems shall be installed on the exterior of all
occupancies, and comply with section 1206.2.8.7. Stationary battery storage systems shall be
installed within eyesight of the main service panel for the occupancy. Stationary battery storage
systems shall have a dedicated disconnect installed for the battery storage system and comply
with sections 1204.5-1205.5.3.

15.28.570 Section 304 of the International Fire Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Section 304 COMBUSTIBLE WASTE MATERIAL.

Section 304.1Waste accumulation prohibited. Combustible waste material creating a
fire hazard shall not be allowed to accumulate in buildings or structures or upon premises.

304.1.1 Waste material. Accumulations of wastepaper, wood, hay, straw, litter or
combustible or flammable waste or rubbish of any type shall not be permitted to remain on the
roof or any court,yard, vacant lot, alley, parking lot, open space, or beneath a grandstand or
bleacher,manufactured home, recreational vehicle or other similar structures.

304.1.2 Vegetation. Weeds, grass or dead palm fronds,dead branches, vines or other
growth that is capable of being ignited and endangering property, shall be cut down and removed
by the owner or occupant of the premises. Vegetation clearance requirements in urban-wildland
interface areas shall be in accordance with chapter 49 and the 20452018 International Wildland-
Urban Interface Code.

15.28.580 Section 905 of the California Fire Code is hereby amended to read as
follows:

Section 905 STANDPIPE SYSTEMS

905.3.1 Height. In other than Group R-3 and R3.1 occupancies, Class Hl standpipe
systems shall be installed throughout each floor where any of the following occur:

1. Buildings where the floor level of the highest story is located more than 30 feet
(9144mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

2. Buildings are three stories in height.

3. Building where the floor level of the lowest story is located more than 30 feet
(9144mm) below the highest level of fire department vehicle access.

4. Buildings that are two or more stories below the highest level of fire department
vehicle access.

The remainder of the section remains as adopted.

SECTION 2. Repealer. Loma Linda Municipal Code Chapter 15.28 is hereby repealed and
replaced as specified in this Ordinance.

SECTION 3. Penalties. If any person shall violate any of the provisions of this Ordinance,
or fail to comply with any of the mandatory requirements of this Ordinance, he shall be
guilty of an infraction. Any person convicted of an infraction under the provisions of a
City Ordinance shall be punishable by (1) a fine of not more than one hundred dollars
($100.00) for a first violation; (2) a fine not exceeding two hundred dollars ($200.00) for a
second violation of the same Ordinance within one year and (3) a fine not exceeding five



Ordinance No.

Page 17

hundred dollars ($500.00) for each additional violation of the same Ordinance within one
year. Each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for every day during
such portion of which any violation of this Ordinance is committed, continued or permitted
by such person, and shall be punishable therefore as provided by this Ordinance.

SECTION 4. Validity. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance is
for any reason held to be invalid, such holding or holdings shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this Ordinance. The City Council hereby declares that it would have passed
this Ordinance and each section, subsection, clause sentence and phrase thereof, irrespective of
the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, clauses, sentences or phrases be declared
invalid.

SECTION 5. Posting. Prior to the expiration of 15 days from its passage, the City clerk shall
cause this Ordinance to be posted pursuant to law in 3 public places designated for such purpose
by the City Council.

This Ordinance was introduced at the regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Loma Linda,
California, held on the 8" day of October 2019 and was adopted on the ___ day of 2019 by the
following vote to wit:

Ayes:
Noes:
Abstain
Absent:

Attest:

Rhodes Rigsby, Mayor

Barbara Nicholson, City Clerk



Council Bill #R-2019-38

RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LOMA LINDA
TO COMPLY WITH THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA HEALTH AND SAFETY CODE
SECTIONS 17958, 17958.5 AND 17958.7 RELATING TO THE ADOPTION OF THE
2016 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

WHEREAS, Health and Safety Code Section 17958 and Government Code Section 50022
empowers the City to adopt by reference the California Building Standards Code, including the California
Fire Code; and

WHEREAS, Health and Safety Code Section 17958.5 authorizes the City to make amendments to
said California Fire Code on the bases of local climatic, geological, or topographical condition; and

WHEREAS, Health and Safety Code Section 17958.7 requires that before making any
modifications or changes pursuant to Section 17958.5, the governing body of a City or County shall make
an express finding of local necessity that such modifications or changes are needed; and

WHEREAS, the City Council is informed and finds that these climatic, geological and
topographical conditions include, but are not limited to the following conditions:

1 The area of the City of Loma Linda receives relatively low amounts of precipitation, and
experiences very low relative humidity levels and extremely high temperatures. These
climatic conditions are conducive to the spread of fire. For example, the measured rainfall
was recorded from the gauge at the City’s Headquarters Fire Station and the recorded
temperatures were recorded at the San Bernardino County Flood Control District Office
located at 825 E. 3" St., San Bernardino for the last three years.

2043: 2017 Maximum temperatures greater than 100°F recorded during the months of
June, July and August. Total recorded annual rainfall of 4:29-4.03 inches, with no
rain measured in the months of April, June, July, August, September, October
November, and December

20142018 Maximum temperatures greater than 100°F recorded during the months of
July, August, September and October. Total recorded annual rainfall of 5:00-13.39
inches, with no rain measured in the months of April Jandary, May, June, July,
August, September and October.

20152019 Maximum temperatures greater than 100°F recorded during the months of
Aprik June, July, August, September and October. Total recorded annual rainfall of
2:64-14.53 inches, with no rain measured in the months of January, February, June,
July, and August.

2. The area of the City of Loma Linda is subject to extremely strong winds, commonly
referred to as "Santa Ana Winds," which can reach speeds of more than 40 miles per hour.
Extensive damage often occurs during such winds including downed trees, power lines,
utility poles and utility service lines. These adverse conditions cause:

a) fires;

b) impairment of emergency apparatus access;

c) delays in response times of emergency apparatus; and

d) the depletion of apparatus readily available for fire suppression activities.

Specific amendments to the California Fire Code contained in Ordinance No. ___ pursuant

to this express finding of local necessity are made to Sections: 901.7, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2,
903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.1.5, 903.2.2, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.4.1, 903.2.7, 903.2.8,
903.2.9, 903.2.9.1, 903.2.9.2, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.11, 903.2.11.1, 903.2.11.3,

CC AGENDAITEM 2b


bnicholson
Typewritten Text
CC AGENDA ITEM 2b


Resolution No.
Page 2

903.2.19, 903.3.1.3, 903.7, 903.8, Fire Sprinklers; 903.3.10, Water Supply; 905.4 Hose
Connections; 910.1 Smoke and Heat Vents, Mechanical Smoke Exhaust Systems and Draft
Curtains; 910.3.4_ Smoke and Heat Vents; 914.12 Special Requirements for Group F, M, S-
1 or S-2 Distribution Warehouses greater than 50,000 square feet in floor area; Table
3206.2 High-piled Combustible Storage; 5601 Fireworks; 4902 & A104.5 Wildland-Urban
Interface Fire Area;605-21 1204, 1206.2 Solar Photovoltaic systems; 304.1 Combustible
waste material; 905.3 Standpipe system height; 4914, Fire Protection Plan; Appendix B
B105.2 Reduction in Required Fire-flow; and Appendix B, B105.7.1 and B105.7.2. Two
points of connection creating a Fire Loop system.

Within the area of the City of Loma Linda there are three earthquake faults:

a) the San Jacinto Fault;
b) the Loma Linda Fault;
c) the Beaumont-Banning Fault.

Numerous other faults lie in close proximity, including the San Andreas Fault. In the event
of a severe earthquake, these faults present the potential for catastrophic damage,
including extensive damage to buildings, fire, and damage to major infrastructure
including water and sewer distribution lines, roadways, bridges across a major storm
drain and railroad right-of-way, and other impairments to the movement of emergency
apparatus.

Specific amendments to the California Fire Code contained in Ordinance No. ____ pursuant
to this express finding of local necessity are made to Sections: 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2,
903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.1.5, 903.2.2, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.4.1, 903.2.7, 903.2.8,
903.2.9, 903.2.9.1, 903.2.9.2, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.11, 903.2.11.1, 903.2.11.3,
903.2.19, 903.3.1.3, 903.7, 903.8, Fire Sprinklers; 903.3.10, Water Supply; 905.4 Hose
Connections; 910.1 Smoke and Heat Vents, Mechanical Smoke Exhaust Systems and Draft
Curtains; 910.3.4_ Smoke and Heat Vents; 914.12 Special Requirements for Group F, M, S-
1 or S-2 Distribution Warehouses greater than 50,000 square feet in floor area; Table
3206.2 High-piled Combustible Storage; 5601 Fireworks; 4902 Wildland-Urban Interface
Fire Area; 605.11 Solar Photovoltaic systems; 304.1 Combustible waste material; 905.3
Standpipe system height;4914 Fire Protection Plan; Appendix B B105.2 Reduction in
Required Fire-flow, and Appendix B, B105.7.1 and B105.7.2. Two points of connection
creating a Fire Loop system.

Within the area of the City of Loma Linda development has occurred and continues to
occur which has resulted in severe traffic congestion during peak hours. This development
includes high-rise structures, institutional, commercial, industrial and residential structures.
Development has occurred within that portion of the City known as the Loma Linda Hills
where roadways have been built in areas of severe topographical conditions including street
and driveway grades in excess of 12%. Such traffic congestion and severe roadway
conditions extend the time for emergency vehicles to reach the scene of fires and other
emergencies. Such drastic changes in elevation may also at a critical time effect water
systems, delivery or pressures within the Cities water network.

Specific amendments to the California Fire Code contained in Ordinance No. ___ pursuant
to this express finding of local necessity are made to Sections: 901.7, 903.2.1.1, 903.2.1.2,
903.2.1.3, 903.2.1.4, 903.2.1.5, 903.2.2, 903.2.3, 903.2.4, 903.2.4.1, 903.2.7, 903.2.8,
903.2.9, 903.2.9.1, 903.2.9.2, 903.2.10, 903.2.10.1, 903.2.11, 903.2.11.1, 903.2.11.3,
903.2.19, 903.3.1.3, 903.7, 903.8, Fire Sprinklers; 903.3.10, Water Supply; 905.4 Hose
Connections; 910.1 Smoke and Heat Vents, Mechanical Smoke Exhaust Systems and Draft
Curtains; 910.3.4_ Smoke and Heat Vents; 914.12 Special Requirements for Group F, M, S-



Resolution No.
Page 3

1 or S-2 Distribution Warehouses greater than 50,000 square feet in floor area; Table
3206.2 High-piled Combustible Storage; 5601 Fireworks; 4902 & A104.5 Wildland-Urban
Interface Fire Area; 605-21 1204, 1206.2 Solar Photovoltaic systems; 304.1 Combustible
waste material; 905.3 Standpipe system height; 4914 Fire Protection Plan; Appendix B
B105.2 Reduction in Required Fire-flow, and Appendix B, B105.7.1 and B105.7.2. Two
points of connection creating a Fire Loop system.

WHEREAS, the City Council is informed and finds that because the City is subject to the above
referenced climatic, geological and topographical conditions that amendments to the California Fire Code,
2010 Edition, are necessary to protect life and property, and that such amendments are to deal with the
following issues: 1) high fire hazard areas; 2) water supplies; 3) fire extinguishing systems and sprinkler
systems, and 4) the storage, handling and use of flammable and combustible liquids and hazardous
materials;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of Loma Linda does
hereby establish that the modifications to the 2040 2019 California Fire Code, as outlined in Ordinance No.
673 are necessary due to local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a copy of this Resolution be forwarded to the State of
California Building Standards Commission;

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that a copy of this Resolution shall be incorporated and filed with
Ordinance No. .

PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED this 8" day of October 2019 by the following vote:

Ayes:.
Noes:
Abstain:
Absent:

Rhodes Rigsby, Mayor

ATTEST:

Barbara Nicholson, City Clerk



Council Bill #0-2019-07

ORDINANCE NO.
AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF LOMA LINDA
ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 2645 2018 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE.
The City Council of the City of Loma Linda does hereby ordain as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapter 15.30 of Title 15 of the Loma Linda Municipal Code is hereby added to
read as follows:

Chapter 15.30
WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE
Sections:
15.30.010 Findings and Adoption of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code
15.30.020 Definitions

15.30.030-220 Amendments to the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code
15.30.010 Findings and Adoption of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code
(@) FINDINGS. The City Council of the City of Loma Linda hereby finds and determines:

1. That the International Code Council (ICC) is a private organization which has been in
existence for a period of at least three years.

2. That the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code (IWUIC), 2015 2018 Edition,
published by said organization, is a nationally recognized compilation of proposed rules, regulations, and
standards of said organization.

3. That said International Wildland-Urban Interface Code has been printed and published as
a code in book form within the meaning of Section 50022.2 et seq. of the California Government Code.

4, That one copy of the 2045—2018 International Wildland-Urban Interface Code, certified
by the Clerk of the City of Loma Linda to be a true copy, have been filed for use and examination by the
public in the Fire Prevention office of the Fire Department of the City of Loma Linda.

5. The sections of said International Wildland-Urban Interface Code may be referred to by
the number used in said published compilation, preceded by the words “International Wildland-Urban
Interface Code Section” or "Wildland-Urban Interface Code Section" or “WUI Code Section,” and may
also be referred to by additional reference to the Loma Linda Municipal Code and sections therein
pertaining to said International Wildland-Urban Interface Code.

(b) ADOPTION OF THE THE INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE CODE.

The City Council of the City of Loma Linda hereby adopts and amends the 20452018 Edition of
the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code, and International Wildland-Urban Interface Code
Appendices A, B and D; as compiled and published by the International Code Council.

CC AGENDAITEM 2c


bnicholson
Typewritten Text
CC AGENDA ITEM 2c


Ordinance No.
Page 2

15.30.020 Definitions.

@ Wherever the word "Jurisdiction™ is used in said Wildland-Urban Interface Code, it shall mean
the City of Loma Linda.

(b) Wherever the term “Code Official” is used in said Wildland-Urban Interface Code, it shall mean
the Fire Marshal for the City of Loma Linda.

©) Wherever the term "Corporation Counsel™ is used in said Wildland-Urban Interface Code, it shall
mean the City Attorney for the City of Loma Linda.

(d) Wherever the term "Fire Department” is used in said Wildland-Urban Interface Code, it shall
mean the Fire Department of the City of Loma Linda.

©)] An employee of the Fire Department of the City of Loma Linda, when enforcing the International
Wildland-Urban Interface Code, the Loma Linda Municipal Code and other laws, rules and regulations
relating to fire and life safety, fire prevention and fire investigation, shall be deemed a "Peace Officer" as
those words are used in Section 830.31 of the California Penal Code.

15.30.030 Section 101.1 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Wildland-Urban Interface Code of the City
of Loma Linda, hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

15.30.040 Section 105.3 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

105.3 Alternative materials or methods. The code official, in concurrence with approval from
the building official and fire chief, is authorized to approve alternative materials or methods,
provided that the code official finds that the proposed design, use or operation satisfactorily
complies with the intent of this code and that the alternative is, for the purpose intended, at least
equivalent to the level of quality, strength, effectiveness, fire resistance, durability and safety
prescribed by this code. Approvals under the authority herein contained shall be subject to the
approval of the building official where the alternate material or method involves matters
regulated by the California Building Code. The code official shall require that sufficient evidence
or proof be submitted to substantiate any claims made regarding the use of alternative materials
or methods. The details of any action granting approval of an alternative_shall be recorded and
entered in the files of the code enforcement agency. Where the alternative method of
construction is not approved, the code official shall respond in writing, stating the reasons the
alternative was not approved.

15.30.050 Section 107.3 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

107.3 Work exempt from permit. Unless othrwise provided in the requirements of the
California Building Code, a permit shall not be required for the following: (Remainder of section
remains the same.)

15.30.060 Section 26421109.6 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby added
to read as follows:



Ordinance No.
Page 3

10711109.6 Permit Fees. Permit fees as established by City Council Resolution shall be
collected by the Finance Department. Proof of receipt shall accompany all applications for permit
applications prior to inspection and approval by the code official.

15.30.070 Section 107.12 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby added to
read as follows:

10742 109.7 Fees Not Refundable. Permit fees shall not be refundable for any reason after
initiation of inspection procedures.

15.30.080 Section 108.3 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

108.3 Site plan. In addition to the requirements for plans in the California Building Code, site
plans shall include topography, width and prcent of grade of access roads, landscape and
vegetation details, locations of structures or building envelopes, existing or proposed overhead
utilities, occupancy classification of buildings, types of ignition-resistant constrction of buildings,
structures and their appendages, roof classification of buildings, and site water supply systems.

15.30.090 Section 309124 110.12.40f the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby
added to read as follows:

109-1.2:4110.1.2.4 Inspection fees. The code official is authorized to collect appropriate fees for
inspections according to City Council Resolution establishing fees.

15.30.100 Section 201.3 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

201.3 Terms defined in other codes. Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined
in other California or International Codes, such terms shall have the meanings ascribed to them
as in those codes.

15.30.110 Section 202, definition of “BUILDING OFFICIAL,” of the International Wildland-Urban
Interface Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

BUILDING OFFICIAL. The officer or other designated authority charged with the
administration and enforcement of the California Building Code, or the building official’s duly
authorized representative.

15.30.120 Section 202, definition of “FUEL, HEAVY,” of the International Wildland-Urban
Interface Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

FUEL, HEAVY. Vegetation consisting of round wood 3 to 8 inches (76 to 203 mm) in diameter.
Heavy fuels represent dense conifer stands where there is a heavy accumulation of litter and
downed woody material. See applicable National Fire Danger Rating system (NFDR), fuel
models G & U as described in Appendix D.

15.30.130 Section 202, definition of “FUEL, LIGHT,” of the International Wildland-Urban
Interface Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
FUEL, LIGHT. Vegetation consisting of herbaceous plants and round wood less than 1/4 inch
(6.4 mm) in diameter. Light fuels represent western grasslands vegetated by annual or perennial
grasses and forbs. Grasses and forbs are the primary ground fuel, but there can be enough needle
litter and branch wood present from an open pine stand to contribute to the fuel loading. See



Ordinance No.
Page 4

applicable National Fire Danger Rating system (NFDR), fuel models A, C & L as described in
Appendix D.

15.30.140 Section 202, definition of “FUEL, MEDIUM,” of the International Wildland-Urban
Interface Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

FUEL, MEDIUM. Vegetation consisting of round wood 1/4 to 3 inches (6.4 mm to 76 mm) in
diameter. Medium fuels represent mature, dense fields of California mixed chaparral. See
applicable National Fire Danger Rating system (NFDR), fuel models B & F as described in
Appendix D.

15.30.150 Section 202, definition of “FUEL MODIFICATION,” of the International Wildland-
Urban Interface Code is hereby added to read as follows:

FUEL MODIFICATION. A strip of land where combustible vegetation has been thinned,
modified or both and partially or totally replaced with approved drought-tolerant, fire-resistant,
and/or irrigated plants to provide an acceptable level of risk from vegetation fires. Fuel
modification reduces radiant and convective heat, thereby reducing the amount of heat exposure
on the roadway or structure and providing fire suppression forces a safer area in which to take
action.

15.30.160 Section 202, definition of “HEAVY TIMBER CONSTRUCTION,” of the International
Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

HEAVY TIMBER CONSTRUCTION. As described in the California Building Code.

15.30.170 Section 404.5, Subsection 2, Exception, of the International Wildland-Urban Interface
Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Exception: A reduction in required flow rate of up to 50 percent, as approved by the code
official, is allowed where the building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system.
The resulting water supply shall not be less that 1,500 gallons per minute (94.6 L/s).

15.30.180 Section 404.10.3 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended
to read as follows:

404.10.3 Standby power. Stationary water supply facilities within the wildland-urban interface
area dependent on electrical power to meet adequate water supply demands shall provide standby
power systems in accordancce with section 604 of_the California Fire Code and section 2702 of
the California Building Code to ensure that an uninterrupted water supply is maintained. The
standby power source shall be capable of providing power for not less than two hours.
(Remainder of section remains the same.)

15.30.190 Section 501.1 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

501.1 Scope. Buildings and structures shall be constructed in accordance with the California
Building Code and this code. (Remainder of section remains the same.)

15.30.200 Section 504.3 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:
504.3 Protection of eaves. Eaves and soffits shall be protected on the exposed underside by
materials approved for not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated construction, 2-inch (51 mm)
nominal dimension lumber, or 1-inch (25.4 mm) nominal fire-retardant-treated lumber or %-inch



Ordinance No.
Page 5

(19 mm) nominal fire-retardant-treated plywood, identified for exterior use and meeting the
requirements of Section 2303.2 of the California Building Code. Fascias are required and shall
be protected on the backside by materials approved for not less than of 1-hour fire-resistance-
rated construction or 2-inch (51 mm) nominal dimension lumber.

15.30.210 Section 504.7 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

504.7 Appendages and projections. Unenclosed accessory structures attached to buildings with
habitable spaces and projections, such as decks, shall be not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated
construction, heavy timber construction or constructed of approved noncombustible materials or
fire-retardant-treated wood identified for exterior use and meeting the requirements of Section
2303.2 of the California Building Code. (Remainder of section remains the same.)

15.30.220 Section 505.7 of the International Wildland-Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to
read as follows:

505.7 Appendages and projections. Unenclosed accessory structures attached to buildings with
habitable spaces and projections, such as decks, shall be not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated
construction, heavy timber construction or constructed of approved noncombustible materials or
fire-retardant-treated wood identified for exterior use and meeting the requirements of Section
2303.2 of the California Building Code. (Remainder of section remains the same.)

15.30.230 Section A104.5 of the International Wildland Urban Interface Code is hereby amended to read
as follows:

A104.5 Equipment and devices generating heat, sparks, or open flames: Only portable BBQO's
using one pound propane fuel supply shall be allowed in all Wildland areas and community parks in the
City of Loma Linda. i.e. Leonard Bailey Park, Hulda Crooks Park, Cottonwood Park, Elmer Digneo
Park, Seamont Park, Ted and Lila Dawson Park.

SECTION 2. Penalties. If any person shall violate any of the provisions of this Ordinance,
or fail to comply with any of the mandatory requirements of this Ordinance, he shall be guilty of an
infraction. Any person convicted of an infraction under the provisions of a City Ordinance shall be
punishable by (1) a fine of not more than one hundred dollars ($100.00) for a first violation; (2) a
fine not exceeding two hundred dollars ($200.00) for a second violation of the same Ordinance
within one year and (3) a fine not exceeding five hundred dollars ($500.00) for each additional
violation of the same Ordinance within one year. Each such person shall be deemed guilty of a
separate offense for every day during such portion of which any violation of this Ordinance is
committed, continued or permitted by such person, and shall be punishable therefore as provided
by this Ordinance.

SECTION 3. Validity. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance is
for any reason held to be invalid, such holding or holdings shall not affect the validity of the remaining
portions of this Ordinance. The City Council hereby declares that it would have passed this Ordinance
and each section, subsection, clause sentence and phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or
more sections, subsections, clauses, sentences or phrases be declared invalid.

SECTION 4. Posting. Prior to the expiration of 15 days from its passage, the City clerk shall
cause this Ordinance to be posted pursuant to law in 3 public places designated for such purpose by the
City Council.



Ordinance No.
Page 6

This Ordinance was introduced at the regular meeting of the City Council of the City of Loma
Linda, California, held on the 8" day of October 2019 and was adopted on the day of
2019 by the following vote to wit:

Ayes:
Noes:
Absent:
Abstain:

Rhodes Rigsby, Mayor

Attest:

Barbara Nicholson, City Clerk



City of Loma Linda

25541 Barton Road, Loma Linda, CA 92354 @& (909) 799-2830 & (909) 799-2894
Community Development Department

CITY COUNCIL STAFF REPORT Approved/Continued/Denied
MEETING OF OCTOBER 8, 2019 By City Council

TO: City Council Date: ‘

FROM: Konrad Bolowich, Assistant City Manager/Community Development Directc%&/

SUBJECT: Tentative Tract Map Application No. P18-164 for Tract Map 20226

RECOMMENDATION

Staff and Planning Commission recommend City Council take the following action:

APPROVE Tentative Tract Map Application No. P18-164 to allow the demolition of an existing
residence and entitlement of a 16 lot single-family residential subdivision and one lettered lot
(“A”) for open space, drainage and landscape purposes on 4.52 acres within Tract Map No.
20226 on two existing parcels located south of 1% Street and west of California Street, based on
the Findings contained in the Staff Report and subject to the Conditions of Approval.

SUMMARY

The Applicant is requesting the approval of Tentative Tract Map 20226 which includes
demolition of an existing residence and entitlement of a 16-lot single-family residential
subdivision and one lettered lot (“A”) for open space, drainage, and landscaping purposes within
a Low-Density Residential Land Use Designation and Single-Family Residential (R-1) zone. Lot
density proposed is 3.54 du/ac. The project site is located south of 1% Street and west of
California Street on two parcels totaling 4.52-acres and currently identified as Assessor’s Parcel
Numbers: 0293-302-30 and 0292-041-51. Project includes road improvements and a new street.
~ At this time, no residential development is being proposed.

The proposed in-fill subdivision is categorically exempt from the California Environmental
Quality Act (CEQA). The application was subject to the Planning Commission’s review; the
Commission served as an advisory board in regard to this application. On September 18, 2019,
the Commission made a recommendation of approval. As required by the Loma Linda Municipal
Code, the final approval of all subdivisions, including tentative tract maps, shall be ratified by
City Council,

CC AGENDAITEM 3



bnicholson
Typewritten Text
CC AGENDA ITEM 3


City Council Staff Report Page 2 of 9
Meeting of October 8, 2019

PERTINENT DATA
Property Owner/Applicant: ~ Dianal. Walayat MD / Land Engineering Consultants, Inc.
General Plan/Zoning: Low-Density Residential/ Single-family Residential (R-1)
Site: 4.52 acres with an existing 2,457 sqft single story residence

and a 457 sqft single story garage to be demolished

Topography: Generally flat
Vegetation: Weeds
Special Features: Residence and nursery (no historical significance)
EXISTING SETTING

The 4.52-acre lot is currently developed with an approximate 2,457 sqft dilapidated single story
residence constructed of wood and stucco built in 1961 and an approximate 427 sqft single story
garage constructed of wood. The site is generally flat and disturbed with the exception of
scattered pepper/palm trees and dense weeds. Currently a chain link fence divides the eastern
border from the San Bernardino County Flood Control District’s (SBCFCD) properties. The
project site is surrounded by existing development and includes the end of a cul-de-sac and
access to the San Timoteo Creek to the north, vacant land and SBCFCD to the east, residential to
the west, and the Southern Pacific Railroad to the south.

ANALYSIS

Project Description

The Applicant is requesting the approval of Tentative Tract Map 20226 (Application No. P18-
164) to create a 16-lot single-family residential subdivision and one lettered lot (“A™) on a 4.52-
acre lot. The project includes open space, drainage, landscaping and the installation of a new
street. The lot density is proposed as 3.54 lots per acre. The project site is within the Low-
Density Residential Land Use Designation and Single-Family Residential Zone (R-1) which
allows up to 4 units per acre area.

Additionally, on September 18, 2019, the Planning Commission granted a variance to the
Applicant to install an 8-foot wall on the southern boundary line. The 8-foot wall required
approval of the variance request application because it exceeded the 6-foot maximum allowance
in height in residential districts. Future homes will be built adjacent to the rail road track; the
wall will serve as a barrier to the sound and vibrations of the trains, When a developer comes
forward with a design proposal, a noise study will be required of the new applicant to determine
if any other requirements are necessary or recommended.

Slope and landscape easements along both sides of California Street have already been granted,
along with a right-of-way dedication from SBCFCD to the City of Loma Linda to construct a
new driveway at the 1% Street cul-de-sac and an access roadway to SBCFCD property and the
new lots. Surrounding land uses and General Plan designations are shown in Table 1, as well as




City Council Staff Report
Meeting of October 8, 2019

development standards for newly created parcels within the Single-Family Residential Zone are

provided in Table 2.

Table 1

Page 3 of 9

General Plan, Zoning and Existing Land Use

General Plan Zoning Existing Use
Project | Low-Density Single-Family Residential (R-1) A Single-Family Residence and
Site Residential nursery/plants; 2nd lot is vacant
North Medium-Density Single-Family Residential (R-1) Residential, end of 1** Street cul-de-

Residential sac, access to San Timoteo Creek
South Low-Density Planned Community (PC) Southern Pacific Railroad; Residential

Residential (past (past railroad tracks)

railroad tracks)
East Low-Density Single-Family Residential (R-1); Vacant SBCFCD lands

Residential Planned Community (PC)
West Medium-Density Single-Family Residential (R-1); Residential

Residential Planned Community (PC)

Table 2

Development Standards for Newly Created Parcels in R-1 Zones

Required/Maximum Allowed Proposed Complies
Density 0-4 units/acre 3.54 Yes
Parcel Size 7,200 sq.ft minimum 7,202 to 28,224 Yes
Parcel Width Standard Parcels: 65 ft. At building set back lines, each lot
Corner Parcels: 65 ft. has minimum 65 ft. width. All lots Yes
Minimum Frontage: 45 f. have minimum frontage of 45 ft.
Parcel Depth 100 f. minimum Depths average at least 100 ft. Yes
Parcel Coverage 40% maximum footprint n/a n/a
Setbacks: 25 ft., with none less than 20 ft. | Shown on plan, from 20 ft. to 60 ft.,
Front (average with 5 or motre parcels with at least a 25 1, average Yes
in new subdivision)
Rear 15 fi. n/a n/a
Side 15 ft. and 5 fi., plus additional n/a o
5 ft. for each story above first a
Access

The Project area is currently accessed via the 1** Street cul-de-sac. Right-of-way dedication was
granted by the San Bernardino County Flood Control District for the extension of 1* Street to the
eastern line of California Street to construct a new driveway dedicated to the City of Loma Linda
for the public right of way and access for the SBCFCD property to the east. Approximately 1,870
lineal feet of new street are proposed within the development. In addition, a Landscape
Maintenance District (LMD) annexation is required as part of the Conditions of Approval for this
project and any future residential development project.




City Council Staff Report Page 4 of 9
Meeting of October 8, 2019

Measure V Compliance

Measure V states that “the purpose and intent of this initiative measure is to amend the Loma
Linda General Plan by the addition of a new growth management element designed to establish
principles of managed growth that will preserve, enhance, and maintain the special quality of life
valued by this community, including the protection of hillside areas, preservation of open space,
and maintenance of safe, quiet residential areas so that future development within the City will
occur in a way that promotes the social and economic well-being of the entire community.”

Section II of the Principles of Managed Growth (Measure V) states that new infill construction
of individual single-family homes on existing lots of record that are smaller than five (5) acres,
and bounded on three sides by developed properties, are exempt from the traffic level of service
requirements. The Project occurs on an infill site and does not propose the development of new
housing and shall be exempt from certain restrictions set forth in the Principles of Managed
Growth.

However, due to prior concerns from local residents in regards to traffic in the area, city staff
requested that the applicant obtain an assessment form a qualified traffic engineer. A trip
generation analysis for the proposed tract map area was completed by Ganddini Group, a
transportation and environmental analysis firm. See Attachment D: Traffic Study Analysis. The
firm determined the proposed project is forecasted to generate approximately 151 daily trips,
including 12 trips during the AM peak hour and 16 trips during the PM peak hour. Because the
project will generate fewer than 100 peak hour trips, and it is not located within 300 feet of an
intersection of two streets designated as “Collector” or higher, there are no apparent safety or
operation concerns with the implementation of the project. Therefore, Gandinni Group
determined that further traffic analysis was not necessary for the project.

California Environmental Quality Act

The proposed subdivision is categorically exempt from the California Environmental Quality Act
(CEQA) because it meets the conditions required for in-fill development projects pursuant to
CEQA Guidelines Section 15332 which states no environmental review or analysis is required
for an in-fill development project that is consistent with the general plan, has no value as habitat
for endangered species, would not result in any significant effects relating to traffic, noise, air
quality, greenhouse gases or water, it is no more than 5 acres, it is surrounded by urban uses, and
it is in an area where all required utilities and public services are available to allow for maximum
development permissible by the City of Loma Linda. The Community of Development
Department and the Planning Commission’s review of the site plans and studies revealed the
Project does not result in any additional significant impacts. A Notice of Exemption for CEQA
was filed at with the County of San Bernardino on September 23, 2019. No further
environmental review is necessary.

Cultural Resources Investigation and Findings

In August 2019, a Phase I Cultural Resource Investigation for the Project was performed by
McKenna et al. in compliance with CEQA. To adequately investigate and address the project
area for compliance with CEQA, the following tasks were completed: (1) Archaeological
Records Search, (2) Native American Consultation, (3) Paleontological Overview, (4) Historic
Background Research, and a (5) Field Survey. As a result of the recent investigations and field




City Council Staff Report Page 5 of 9
Meeting of October 8, 2019

survey, McKenna et al. concluded there was no evidence of paleontological resources within the
project area. Additionally, there was no surface evidence of Native American archaeological
resources, although there is still a low to moderate potential for buried resources.

The Project Site was improved prior to 1915 and likely prior to 1910, but these improvements
have been demolished. The deTelles property improvements were demolished in 1961 and the
Martinez et al. improvements in 2003. Unfortunately, there is little documentation reported with
respect to these improvements. The Redlands Central Railway (1888 to 1916) is present in ruins.
There is part of a berm, some ties, and some stakes. There are no rails and a portion of the
alignment has been overtaken with tree growth, and what does remain lacks integrity.

The 1961 residential improvement remains, but in a significantly altered state and with no
architectural integrity. The door and windows have been replaced, the structure has been re-
roofed, additions added, and the attached garage has been converted to living space. The
residence is currently in a state of disrepair, and its surrounding components, are not historically
significant. Nonetheless, there is a level of sensitivity for the presence of buried paleontological
and Native American cultural resources., There is also a potential for buried historic
archaeological resources. Based on these conclusions, McKenna et al. made several
recommendations, summarized below:

1. Paleontological Monitoring: In the event, ground-disturbing activities which exceed
ten feet below the current surface of the property, will occur, the applicant shall
implement a paleontological monitoring program This program must conform to the
policies and guidelines of the San Bernardino County Museum and any identified and
recovered specimens must be analyzed, recorded, and prepared for curation at the
Museum.

2. Human Remains: If, at any time, evidence of human remains (or potentially human
remains) are uncovered, a perimeter must be established around the find (minimum of
50 feet), the County Coroner must be notified immediately and permitted to examine
the remains in situ. If the remains are determined to be of Native American origin,
the Coroner will contact the Native American Heritage Commission and the
Commission will identify the Most Likely Descendant (MLD). In consultation with
the  Lead Agency, project proponent, consulting archaeologist, and MLD, the
disposition of the remains will be determined. Any cost incurred will be the
responsibility or the project proponent.

FINDINGS

Tentative Tract Map Findings

Pursuant to the Subdivision Map Act, Section 66474, a parcel map shall be approved if the
following applicable Findings can be made:

1. That the proposed map is consistent with the applicable general plan and zoning
designations.




City Council Staff Report Page 6 of 9
Meeting of October 8, 2019

The project includes a tract map to create 16 individual residential lots. The proposed map is
consistent with the goals and policies of the General Plan’s Low Density Residential Land
Use Designation as well as the Single-Family Residential Zone (R-1). The subject site is
currently being used as a single-family residence and will continue to do so until approval of
the TTM with the newly created lots. In addition, the new lots will help meet the following
housing goals listed in the City of Loma Linda’s General Plan, Housing Element chapter:

¢ Provide adequate sites to meet the 2014-2021 RHNA.

e Address and where appropriate, and legally possible, remove governmental constraints to
housing development. '

e Promote equal housing opportunity.

2. The design or improvement of the proposed subdivision is consistent with the épplicable
general plan and zoning designations.

The proposed TTM complies with the proposed “Low Density Residential” General Plan
Land Use designation and was designed in accordance with the Municipal Code, Chapter
17.34 Single Residence (R-1) zone. The existing designation allows up to 4 dwelling units
per acre. The site is approximately 4.5 acres in size. The project as proposed is developed at
3.54 lots per acre, within the allowable density of the Low Density Residential land use
designation of the General Plan. The 16 residential lots would range in size from 7,202
square feet to 28,224 square feet which comply with the minimum lot area of Section
17.34.040 — Minimum Lot Area, and with the Measure V Principle One, (1) Definitions, (¢)
Minimum Residential Lot Size. The site is completely disturbed and has already been
developed with existing and past residences that were previously demolished. The
development of this site with the appropriate residential uses shall enhance the quality of the
surrounding neighborhood and the City.

3. The site is physically suitable for the type of development proposed.

The project shall not disrupt or divide the physical arrangement in the immediate vicinity.
Development will generally enhance the area. The project would not result in impacts to the
established community. The use of the land for only one single-family residence is no longer
economically viable and development of 16 single-family residences will be compatible with
existing residential development within the vicinity and future residential development. In
addition, the future development of the homes will help the city meet their state housing
requirements. The proposed parcels are physically suitable for the proposed lot consolidation,
demolition of existing structure, and the construction of the 16-lot project.

4. The site is physical suitable for the proposed density of development.

The site is approximately 4.5 acres in size. The existing land use designation allows up to 4
dwelling units per acre. The project as proposed is developed at 3.54 lots per acre, within the
allowable density of the Low Density Residential land use designation of the General Plan.
The 16 residential lots would range in size from 7,202 square feet to 28,224 square feet
which comply with the minimum lot area of Section 17.34.040 — Minimum Lot Area, and
with the Measure V Principle One, (1) Definitions, (c) Minimum Residential Lot Size.




City Council Staff Report Page 7 of 9
Meeting of October 8, 2019

5. The design of the subdivision is not likely to cause substantial environmental damage or
substantially and unavoidably injure fish and wildlife or their habitat.

A biological assessment by L&L Environmental Inc. was provided by the applicant. The
general biological survey detected no state or federal listed or special status plant or wildlife
species in the survey area. Potentially suitable habitat for burrowing owl is present, but a
focused survey for burrowing owl was negative. Suitable habitat for nesting birds was
present, but no active nests were observed. Although no burrowing owl or burrowing owl
sign was observed on the subject property during the focused survey, a preconstruction
clearance survey (valid for 30 days) is recommended due to the presence of potentially
suitable habitat and burrows. The survey will be made a condition of approval with the future
submittal of a Precise Plan of Design application for the construction of the residences. If
active nests are located during preconstruction surveys, avoidance buffers should be
implemented to minimize impacts to nesting birds.

There is no natural vegetation or wildlife present or undisturbed area remaining on the
subject site. All of the parcels associated with the lot consolidation and map are developed.
Therefore, the design of the proposed map would not cause any substantial environmental
damage or substantially and unavoidably injure fish and wildlife or their habitat.

6. The design of the subdivision is not likely to cause serious public health problems.

The design of the subdivision and the end use of the residential tract would not cause any
serious public health problems. All proposed streets and public right-of-ways shall comply
with the City of Loma Linda’s street standards. Development on the proposed residential lots
shall comply with the development standards identified in the Single-Family Residence (R-1)
zone. The reports and studies provided did not identify any impacts that could cause serious
public health problems. While the project includes a variance request for an 8-foot high block
wall along the rear property line, the Southern Pacific Railroad is located to the south of the
subject site and will therefore not negatively impact the subdivision project. The proposed
block wall will help reduce the noise from the trains that pass by. Prior to the review of
residential plans and a submitted Precise Plan of Design application, an acoustical analysis
will be required.

7. The design of the subdivision will not conflict with easements, acquired by the public at
large, for access through or use of property within the proposed subdivision.

Traffic ingress/egress from the proposed TTM onto adjacent exterior roadways would be
provided by one new street and cul-de-sac. There will be ingress/egress that will exit onto
California Street. Emergency vehicles would exit through a fire gate onto the alley way that
exits onto 1% Street. All entries will comply with required sighting distances and street
requirements, All entrances into the site allow full access without impeding the through
traffic. Access for an emergency vehicle is adequate with a 31-foot wide gate. The applicant
is designing a 36-foot wide street and a 52-foot turn-around.

All easements have been identified on the map. In addition, the applicant has been granted
approval from the San Bernardino County Flood Control District for an easement for the cul-
de-sac street and to improve a slope and landscape an area on California Street. The design of
the proposed subdivision does not conflict with any easements or hinder access to the site.




City Council Staff Report Page 8 of 9
Meeting of October 8, 2019

" AB52 TRIBAL NOTICING AND COMMENTS

The level of Native American consultation for this undertaking (residential development) was
determined to be at the AB-52 level and the responsibility of the City of Loma Linda. On May
6, 2019, the City sent letters to local Native American representatives with concerns for
resources within Loma Linda. With the project area being relatively close to Guachama, San
Timoteo Canyon, San Timoteo Wash, and the San Bernardino Asistencia, along with the known
presence of Native American resources identified in the general area, the City is aware of the
general sensitivity for the area to yield additional evidence of Native American resources,
although no Native American resources have been reported for this specific propetty (to date).

The recent intensive survey of the property (McKenna 2019) yielded no surface evidence of any
Native American cultural resources. This finding does not negate the potential for buried
resources. However, it is noted that impacts to the property over the course of the past 131 years
(ca. 1888-2019) has not exposed any evidence of buried resources. If such resources are present,
they would likely be associated with the Serrano, Gabrielino, or Luiseno, with some weight
being given to the Serrano (nearest Native American community).

Ms. Jessica Mauck, a Cultural Resources Analyst for the San Manuel Band of Mission Indians,
has previously confirmed the project area is within or nearby the traditiona<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>